
GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A. 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 
500 IDS CENTER 
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET 
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402 

WWW,GPMLAW.COM 

PHONE 612 632 3000 
FAX 612 632 4444 
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154 

FEDERAL ID 411411978 

Nelson, Tyka 
539 Newton Avenue N. 
Minneapolis, MN 55405 

July 25, 2016 
Invoice# 721835 

For Professional Services Rendered in Connection with: 
411771 

Administration of the Prince Rogers Nelson Estate 

Date Timekeeger Hours Amount Description 
05/03/16 N. Abramson 0.90  Review draft right of publicity statute; discuss same 

with M. Shea; draft reply email for M. Shea regarding 
concerns about the draft. 

05/03/16 D. McBeth 0.75  Email correspondence with B. Dillon and N. 
Abramson; assessment of state legislative session for 
right of publicity legislation. 

05/04/16 N. Abramson 0.80  Communicate with counsel regarding right of 
publicity statute; telephone conference with J. 
Leviton regarding our comments on statute.; 
communicate with team regarding changes to statue 
and strategy. 

05/04/16 D. McBeth 1.75  Legislative consultations with Stinson Leonard Street 
attorneys; communications to B. Dillon; pursuit of 
state bar position on right of publicity legislation. 

05/05/16 N. Abramson 0.20  (No Charge) Communicate with co-counsel regarding 
legislative strategy. 

05/05/16 D. McBeth 0.16  Scheduling with Stinson Leonard Street government 
relations team; communications to B. Dillon. 

05/06/16 N. Abramson 1.10  Exchange emails with team on legislative actions; 
discuss right of publicity with D. McBeth in 
preparation for Legislative meetings on Monday and 
Tuesday; review message from J. Leviton regarding 
statute amendments; review amendments; telephone 
conference with J. Leviton regarding same; research 
domicile v. residence in statute language. 

EXHIBIT 

j 
PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT 

CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT INCLUDED. 
DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE INVOICES. 
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Nelson, Tyka July 25, 2016 
Page 2 Invoice# 721835 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/06/16 D. McBeth 1.66  Review background materials on right of publicity and 

draft legislation; communications with B. Dillon; 
conversation with N. Abramson regarding draft 
legislation. 

05/09/16 N. Abramson 0.40  Review communications on bill from Legislature and 
from trust and estate groups. 

05/09/16 D. McBeth 1.25  Meeting with Stinson team and legislative PR advisor 
regarding press release and ROP bill introductions; 
meeting with Rep. Scott; communications with B. 
Dillon, M. Shea and N. Abramson. 

05/10/16 N. Abramson 0.40  Review article on bill; respond to points raised in 
email memo; communicate with D. McBeth regarding 
info requested by Legislature. 

05/10/16 D. McBeth 2.25  Discussions with Stinson government relations team; 
monitor House Civil Law Committee hearing 
considering HF 3994; email correspondence with B. 
Dillon and M. Shea regarding potential statement 
from family/beneficiaries on proposed legislation; 
discussion with lobbyist for MN Newspaper 
Association regarding concerns on HF 3994. 

05/11/16 N. Abramson 0.80  Communicate with D. McBeth regarding pending bill 
and requests of Senate; communicate with M. Cohen 
regarding Privacy law section input; communicate 
with M. Deffner regarding MIPLA providing an 
opinion. 

05/11/16 M. Cohen 0.25  Telephone conference with N. Abramson regarding 
right of publicity legislation; review proposed bill; 
discuss potential efforts to gain support from MSBA 
computer law section. 

05/11/16 D. McBeth 6.50  Attend Senate Judiciary Committee hearing on Right 
of Publicity bill including testimony by opposition 
interests; strategy meetings with Stinson team; 
prepare K. Abdo for testimony; email correspondence 
with Gray Plant Mooty attorneys; pursue MSBA 
position of support; prepare for House consideration 
on floor tomorrow. 
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Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/12/16 N. Abramson 2.00  Communicate with D. McBeth regarding report from 

Legislature; review draft bill; communicate regarding 
expert testimony; review article regarding law 
professor comments; give D. McBeth rebuttal to 
same; communicate with J. Leviton regarding draft 
legislation; telephone conference with B. Pederson 
regarding MIPLA review of bill; 
Review new version of draft bill and provide 
comments to J. Leviton. 

05/12/16 D. McBeth 1.25  Correspondence with Stinson government relations 
lobbyists regarding Right of Publicity bill; meetings 
with House members regarding strategy for floor 
consideration. 

05/13/16 N. Abramson 2.80  Review materials from J. Leviton and respond to 
same; review letter of Electronic Frontier and Tiger 
Woods case and prepare response for J. Leviton; 
review next amended draft of bill and provide 
comments to same; telephone conference with C. 
Hunt regarding bar association approval; telephone 
conference with J. Leviton regarding legislative 
strategy and merits of different proposals and 
arguments; 

05/13/16 D. McBeth 0.75  Review draft amendments and new provisions in 
preparation for Senate Judiciary Committee 
consideration of Right of Publicity bill. 

05/15/16 N. Abramson 0.20  Communicate with D. McBeth regarding legislation. 
05/15/16 D. McBeth 0.75  Review Senate Judiciary Committee amendment A3 

language and correspond with N. Abramson; review 
Star Tribune article regarding Right to Publicity 
legislation. 

05/16/16 N. Abramson a.so  Review article; communicate with co-counsel 
regarding Walker objections; discuss same with team. 

05/16/16 D. McBeth 3.50  Monitor Senate Judiciary Committee hearing; 
conversations with Stinson Government Relations 
team. 

05/17/16 N. Abramson 0.20  Communicate with co-counsel regarding right of 
publicity bill. 
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Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
05/18/16 N. Abramson 0.60  Review email from J. Leviton and respond; telephone 

conference regarding same; communicate with D. 
McBeth regarding update at legislate. 

05/18/16 D. McBeth 3.33  Discussion with Stinson Government Relations team; 
communications with N. Abramson and B. Dillon; 
attend Senate Rules Committee. 

05/19/16 N. Abramson 0.20  Discuss final issues on rights of publicity. 
05/28/16 N. Harwood 6.00  (No Charge) For the week or 5/22 through 5/28: 

 
 

 
06/04/16 N. Harwood 6.00  (No Charge) For the week of 5/29 through 6/4: 

 
 

 
06/11/16 N. Harwood 12.00  (No Charge) For the week of 6/5 through 611:  

 
 

 
 

06/18/16 N. Harwood 5.00  (No Charge) For the week of 6/12 through 6/18: 
Review and participate In communications and 
conferences regarding status. 

06/21/16 D. McBeth 0.13  Conversation with Sen. Scott Newman regarding 
legislation proposing Right of Publicity and chances of 
advancing similar legislation in 2017. 

06/25/16 N. Harwood 5.00  (No Charge) For the week of 6/19 through 6/25: 
Review and participate in communications and 
conferences regarding status and prep for court 
hearing. 

Total Hours 69.38 

Total for Services  

Other Charges 
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Summary by Time Recorder 

Time Recorder Hours Hourly Bill 
Billed Rate Amount 

Norman Abramson 10.90   
Michael Cohen 0.25   
Daryn McBeth 24.03   
Norman Abramson 0.20   
Nevin Harwood 34.00   

Total Services 69.38  
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