
GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A. 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 

500 IDS CENTER 
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET 
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402 

WWW.GPMLAW.COM 

PHONE 612 632 3000 
FAX 612 632 4444 
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154 

FEDERAL ID 41 1411978 

Nelson, Tyka 
539 Newton Avenue N. 
Minneapolis, MN 55405 

December 16, 2016 
Invoice# 734889 

For Professional Services Rendered in Connection with: 
411771 

Administration of the Prince Rogers Nelson Estate 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/03/16 B. Dillon 0.20   

 
 

05/03/16 M. Shea 3.30  Correspondence with various beneficiary counsel 
regarding hearing  

consider matters 
relating to proposed right of publicity statute;  

 
 
 
 

 
 

05/04/16 B. Dillon 4.90  Participate in meetings between counsel for 
beneficiaries  

right of 
publicity legislation, and other estate administration 
matters; participate in subsequent meeting between 
counsel for beneficiaries and Special Administrator 
regarding same;  

 
05/04/16 M. Shea 5.20  Prepare for and conduct meetings with various 

counsel; prepare for and conduct meeting with 
Bremer. 

05/04/16 S. Gaertner 0.60   
 

 

EXHIBIT 

B 

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT 
AMOUNTS BILLED IN U.S. DOLLARS. CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT 

INCLUDED.DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE 
INVOICES. 
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 2 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/05/16 J. Anderson 1.70   

 
05/05/16 B. Dillon 2.60   

 
 
 

 
 strategize with D. McBeth regarding legislation 

on right of publicity. 
05/06/16 B. Dillon 2.80  Status conference with the Court and counsel for 

beneficiaries;  
 

 
 
 

 
 

05/06/16 M. Shea 5.00  Prepare for and conduct Court telephone call; 
 
 

 
 work on proposed 

right of publicity legislation; review and finalize family 
statement. 

05/06/16 S. Gaertner 0.50   
 

 
05/09/16 B. Dillon 0.70   

 right of publicity legislation and related 
public relations issues,  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 3 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/09/16 M. Shea 0.50  Conference with B. Dillon regarding status update, 

right of publicity legislation, various estate 
adminstration issues,  

 various telephone calls and email exchanges 
regarding various trust administration related 
matters; review new Court pleadings. 

05/09/16 N. Harwood 1.40  (No Charge) Phone conference with B. Dillon 
regarding new petitions filed by claimants and follow 
up from Friday Judge's conference call. 

05/10/16 B. Dillon 2.70   
 
 

 
 

 review 
emails regarding status of right of publicity legislation; 
confer with D. McBeth regarding same. 

05/10/16 M. Shea 2.30  Review and respond to various emails regarding right 
of publicity legislation;  

 
 

05/11/16 B. Dillon 1.80   
 

 confer with K. Abdo and 
GPM team regarding status of right of publicity 
legislation. 

05/11/16 M. Shea 2.00  Confer with team regarding current status of estae 
administration issues, right of publicity,  

 
 

 
05/11/16 N. Harwood 2.00  (No Charge)  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 4 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
05/12/16 B. Dillon 3.00   

 
 

confer with Lommen Abdo regarding status of right of 
privacy legislation,  

 
 

05/12/16 M. Shea 1.90  Office conference and email exchanges with B .Dillon 
regarding various issues relating to right of privacy 
legislation,  

 
 

05/12/16 N. Harwood 1.00  (No Charge) Telephone conferences with B. Dillon 
regarding estate issues. 

05/13/16 B. Dillon 4.20  Weekly telephone conference with Court and counsel 
for Bremer and all beneficiaries regarding case status; 

 
email Stinson and beneficiaries' counsel regarding 
proposal for genetic testing; review email updates on 
right of publicity legislation. 

05/13/16 M. Shea 3.70  Weekly telephone conference with Court, counsel, 
and beneficiaries regarding case status; review and 
respond to various emails with beneficiaries' counsel 
regarding proposal for genetic testing related 
matters, and updates on right of publicity legislation. 

05/14/16 B. Dillon 0.20  Telephone call with S. Friedman regarding genetic 
testing. 

05/16/16 B. Dillon 1.80   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 5 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
05/16/16 M. Shea 1.60   

 
 prepare for and 

participate on conference call with counsel regarding 
status update. 

05/16/16 N. Harwood 2.00  (No Charge)  
 
 
 

 
 

05/17/16 B. Dillon 0.40  Email beneficiaries' counsel regarding thoughts 
related to proposed order on genetic testing. 

05/17/16 M. Shea 0.20  Research Parentage Act case; confer with team 
counsel regarding proposed order on genetic testing. 

05/17/16 N. Harwood 1.00  (No Charge)  
 

 
05/18/16 B. Dillon 0.20   

 
05/19/16 B. Dillon 2.70  Review new objections to genetic testing;  

 
 
 

 
 

05/19/16 M. Shea 2.80  Participate in heirs' counsel conference call;  
 

 
 review objections genetic testing; 

 
 

 
 

05/19/16 N. Harwood 1.30  (No Charge)  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 6 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
05/20/16 B. Dillon 2.50  Weekly telephone conference with Court, 

Stinson/Bremer and counsel; telephone conference 
with Lommen Abdo regarding  
heirship claims,  

 
05/20/16 M. Shea 2.50  Participate on weekly telephone conference with 

Court, Bremer and counsel; telephone conference 
with Lommen Abdo counsel regarding  

 heirship claims,  
 

05/23/16 B. Dillon 1.20   
 research on 

Minnesota Parentage Act;  
 

 
05/24/16 B. Dillon 2.40   

 
 
 

 
 

05/25/16 B. Dillon 0.60   
 
 

05/25/16 H. Malcomson 0.60   
 

05/25/16 S. Duniway 0.70   
05/27/16 B. Dillon 1.70  Weekly telephone conference with Court and 

Stinson/Bremer; review DNA testing protocol 
circulated by Stinson/Bremer; research regarding 
Parentage Act presumptions;  

 
 

05/27/16 M. Shea 1.20  Weekly telephone conference with Court and 
Stinson/Bremer;  
review DNA testing protocol;  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 7 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount DescriQtion 
05/31/16 B. Dillon 0.70  Strategize with M. Shea on issues related to media 

access to the courtroom, medical examiner report, 
and genetic testing/Parentage Act. 

05/31/16 M. Shea 0.80  Review Special Administrator's proposed protocol 
prior to genetic testing; review various case law 
interpreting the Parentage Act; confer with B. Dillon 
regarding the same; email exchange with L. Braganca 
regarding request for parentage information; phone 
conference with Stinson/Bremer regarding  

 media access related matters, and 
other developments. 

06/01/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Attend to questions from Stinson/Bremer  
 

review genetic testing protocol filing  
 

 
 

06/01/16 H. Malcomson 0.60   review 
documents regarding parentage request for Special 
Administrator. 

06/02/16 B. Dillon 0.90  Participate in calls with  Stinson 
regarding  

 
06/03/16 M. Shea 2.20  Participate on weekly status call with Court; review 

Special Administrator's correspondence to Judge Eide; 
conference call with counsel regarding Special 
Administrator's motion  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 8 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
06/06/16 M. Shea 1.90  Conference call with counsel regarding  

 
 

 review various email exchanges from counsel; 
 
 
 

 
 status update with team 

counsel  
06/06/16 H. Malcomson 0.70   
06/07/16 M. Shea 1.60  Correspondence with Stinson counsel regarding 

Mattie and John's marriage certificate and divorce 
decree;  

 participate on emergency hearing 
conference call with Judge Eide and counsel of record 
regarding Objection to Retention of Monetization 
Experts;  

 
06/08/16 H. Malcomson 0.50   

 
06/09/16 M. Shea 1.30   

 
correspondence to 

heirs' counsel regarding same; 
06/10/16 M. Shea 1.50  Participate on weekly telephone conference with 

Court, Bremer and counsel;  
 and certified 

copies of death certificate;  
 

 
06/10/16 H. Malcomson 0.20   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 9 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
06/13/16 B. Dillon 0.80  Confer with M. Shea on status of various issues 

(Parentage Act protocol and potential objections; 
hearing on Parentage Act issues;  

 media in the courtroom;  
 telephone 

conference with Lemmen Abdo on above issues. 
06/14/16 B. Dillon 1.00   

 and Parentage Act 
objections; telephone call to Lemmen Abdo regarding 
Parentage Act objections;  

 
 

06/14/16 R. Landon 0.30  Analyze question regarding mechanism for Supreme 
Court review of parentage issue. 

06/15/16 B. Dillon 1.40  Telephone conference with Lemmen Abdo on 
Parentage Act issues  

 
 

correspond with counsel regarding objections to 
media in the courtroom requests;  

 
 

 
06/15/16 M. Shea 1.10  Correspond with counsel regarding objections to 

media in the courtroom for upcoming hearing; 
telephone conference with counsel regarding 
Parentage Act issues  

 
 

06/15/16 H. Malcomson 0.60   review petition and related 
documents in preparation for call. 

06/17/16 B. Dillon 1.80  Participate in weekly status call with the Court and 
counsel; email Stinson/Bremer team regarding claims 
of heirship asserted by descendants of D. Nelson. 
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 10 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
06/20/16 B. Dillon 2.10  Confer with N. Nelson and K. Abdo regarding media 

and publicity issues,  
 
 

 
 

06/20/16 M. Shea 1.00  Correspondence with counsel for other heirs 
regarding media  

 
 correspondence with Special Administrator 

related to various estate administration matters. 
06/21/16 M. Shea 0.60  Correspondence with Bremer regarding other related 

matters; confer with N. Harwood relating to Petition 
for Determination of Heirs, parentage, and other 
related matters. 

06/22/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Correspond with Stinson/Bremer regarding  
 telephone conference with K. Abdo on 

 
 review Court order on media in the 

courtroom; review filings regarding objections to 
application of Parentage Act and genetic testing 
protocols in preparation for Monday hearing. 

06/22/16 M. Shea 1.50  Correspondence with client and others relating to 
results of genetic testing; strategize on hearing, 
determination of heirs, and other related matters. 

06/23/16 M. Shea 1.60  Review new Court filings; compose email to counsel 
for the various heirs relating to upcoming hearing and 
conference call tomorrow;  

 
06/24/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Participate in weekly telephone conference with the 

Court and counsel; participate in subsequent counsel- 
only call. 

06/24/16 M. Shea 2.20  Prepare for and conduct weekly telephone call with 
Court; prepare summary of call with Court and follow- 
up with various matters raised in Court conference 
call; coordination of marriage certificate and other 
related matters for Mattie and John. 
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Nelson, Tyka 
Page 11 

Date TimekeeQer 
06/26/16 M. Shea 

06/27/16 B. Dillon 

06/27/16 M. Shea 

06/28/16 M. Shea 

Hours 
1.20 

December 16, 2016 
Invoice# 734889 

5.10 

3.90 

Arnau nt DescriQtion 
  prepare for hearing 
tomorrow by reviewing various pleadings relating to 
Parentage Act and heir determiniation protocol. 

 Prepare for and attend hearing on application of 
Parentage Act and genetic testing protocol.  

 
 Prepare for and attend hearing in Carver County on 

06/29/16 

06/30/16 

06/30/16 

07/01/16 

B. Dillon 

Parentage Act 
0.60  Correspondence with K. Abdo and A. Gislason related 

to Petition for Determination of Heirs and 
appointment of personal representative;  

 
 

  
 

 
 Review Court orders on post-hearing submissions on 

genetic testing protocol/ Parentage Act and request 
for intervention by Media Coalition;  

 
 

  
 

 
 Telephone conference with all counsel on the post- 

hearing submissions related to the Parentage Act and 
genetic testing protocol; strategize with K. Abdo, A. 
Gislason and M. Shea on Parentage Act and testing 
protocol, Petition for Determination of Heirs and for 
appointment of personal representative, and related 
issues;  

 
 research on trial court certification of 

questions to the Court of appeals; review divorce 
decree of Mattie Shaw and John Nelson. 

0.10 

B. Dillon 2.70 

M. Shea 1.40 

B. Dillon 2.70 
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 12 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount DescriQtion 
07/01/16 M. Shea 0.80  Participate in all counsel conference call;  

 
 
 
 

 
07/01/16 R. Landon 0.20  Strategize with B. Dillon regarding procedure for 

certifying questions to the Minnesota Court of 
Appeals. 

07/02/16 N. Harwood 13.00  (No Charge)  Attend 
6/27 court hearing;  

 
 

07/05/16 B. Dillon 3.50   
 

 
 

 telephone conference with all counsel, 
Stinson/Bremer  regarding 
same; research on appeal procedures, including 
potential pathways to Minnesota Supreme Court. 

07/05/16 M. Shea 2.80   
 

 
 

 analysis of appellate issues; 
prepare for and participate in telephone call with 
heirs counsel regarding  

 
 

07/05/16 R. Landon 0.70  Attend to questions regarding procedure for 
interlocutory appeals and certification of important 
and doubtful questions. 
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 13 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount Descri12tion 
07/06/16 B. Dillon 1.30  Correspond with petition heirs counsel on appellate 

issues regarding Parentage Act and genetic testing 
protocol;  

analyze court 
orders on Parentage Act and filing documents under 
seal. 

07/06/16 M. Shea 0.80  Review correspondence related to appellate issues 
regarding Parentage Act and genetic testing protocol; 

 
 

07/06/16 H. Malcomson 4.50   
 

 
 

 
07/07/16 B. Dillon 0.40  Telephone conference with A. Gislason on Parentage 

Act and related appellate issues. 
07/08/16 B. Dillon 1.80  Telephone conference with counsel for petition heirs 

to strategize on post-hearing submission on 
Parentage Act, genetic testing protocol and appellate 
issues;  

 
telephone conference with D. Crosby regarding 
Stinson/Bremer's thinking regarding post-hearing 
submission on Parentage Act and genetic testing 
protocol;  

 
07/08/16 H. Malcomson 0.30   

 
07/09/16 N. Harwood 5.00  (No Charge)  

 
 

07/11/16 B. Dillon 0.70  Review order on confidentiality of heirship affidavits; 
 

correspond with Lommen Abdo regarding same. 
07/12/16 N. Harwood 2.00  (No Charge)  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 14 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
07/13/16 M. Shea 0.50   

 
 

07/14/16 B. Dillon 7.00   
 

meet with S. 
Silton and M. Shea on Parentage Act claims, 
Determination of Heirship issues,  

 and estate administration issues; review 
draft brief prepared by Lommen Abdo on Parentage 
Act issues; edit brief and conduct follow up research 
regarding same. 

07/14/16 M. Shea 0,30   
review Petition for Determination 

of Heirs;  
 

07/14/16 H. Malcomson 3.50  Draft Petition for Determination of Heirs;  
discuss petition with M. Shea; 

correspond with B. Dillon regarding same;  
 

07/15/16 B. Dillon 3.50  Continue working on edits to brief on Parentage Act 
issues; telephone conferences with D. Crosby on 
Parentage Act briefs and supporting affidavits; weekly 
conference call with Court and Stinson regarding 
estate administration issues. 

07/15/16 M. Shea 1.00  Weekly call with Court. 
07/15/16 H. Malcomson 1.20  Conference call with attorneys and the Court. 
07/15/16 N. Harwood 4.00  (No Charge)  

 
 

07/17/16 H. Malcomson 1.00   
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Date Timekee12er Hours Amount DescriQtion 
07/18/16 B. Dillon 0.60   

 
 
 

 
 

 
07/18/16 H. Malcomson 0.70   

 
 

07/19/16 M. Shea 1.20  Review draft Petition for Determination of Heirs; 
telephone call with J. Bruntjen relating to the Petition 
for Determination of Heirs,  
matters; review various emails regarding same. 

07/20/16 B. Dillon 0.80   
 

 
07/20/16 M. Shea 0.80   

 
07/21/16 B. Dillon 0.40   

 
 

 
07/21/16 M. Shea 1.00   

 
 

 Bremer Trust's Memorandum in Response to 
Media Coalition's Motion to Intervene and related 
court filings. 

07/22/16 B. Dillon 3.90  Telephone conference with court, Stinson, and 
 on estate administration and 

 
meeting with M. Shea and counsel for 0. Baker on 
estate administration issues;  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 16 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount DescriQtion 
07/22/16 M. Shea 3.00  Telephone conference with Court, Stinson, and 

 
and other estate 

administration issues; meeting with counsel for 0. 
Baker on estate administration issues. 

07/22/16 N. Harwood 4.50  (No Charge)  
 

 
07/25/16 B. Dillon 5.60   

prepare for and attend meeting with 
counsel for petition heirs group on estate 
administration issues (Petition for Determination of 
Heirs, media access to  

 
 

finalize Petition for Determination of Heirs and confer 
with H. Malcomson, L. Krishnan, and Y. Shirk 
regarding same;  

 
07/25/16 C. McGreevy 0.20  Assist with petition filing. 
07/25/16 H. Malcomson 0.20   

 
07/28/16 B. Dillon 3.50  Participate in hearing on motion filed by the Media 

Coalition; confer with K. Abdo and A. Gislason on 
talking points for hearing;  

confer with 
L. Krishan on real estate  issues. 

07/29/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Update petition heirs on  
 review order on heirship claims; 

confer with S. Silton and J. Bruntjen on court order on 
heirship claims. 

07/31/16 B. Dillon 0.40   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 17 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/01/16 B. Dillon 3.60  Meeting with petition heirs counsel to discuss estate 

administration issues (order on Parentage Act, 
Petition for Determination,  

 fee reimbursement,  
 

 
 

 
08/01/16 N. Harwood 0.75  (No Charge)  

 
08/02/16 B. Dillon 1.20   

 confer with Stinson (T. Phelps 
and L. Krishnan) on meetings to discuss use of Paisley 
Park. 

08/03/16 B. Dillon 6.60  Confer with D. Crosby on genetic testing of petition 
heirs group;  

 email J. Bruntjen on 
real estate issues; meet with T. Nelson, petition heirs 
group and representatives of Graceland on Paisley 
Park initiative. 

08/04/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Telephone conference with A. Gislason regarding 
 genetic testing issues;  

 
status of Paisley Park negotiations with Graceland, 
and estate administration issues. 

08/04/16 N. Harwood 0.50  (No Charge)  
 

08/05/16 B. Dillon 2.50   
 telephone 

conference with Court and counsel regarding case 
status and management issues; confer with K. Abdo 
and A. Gislason regarding  

 
08/05/16 N. Harwood 1.50  (No Charge)  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 18 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
08/08/16 B. Dillon 2.10   

 telephone conference 
with Stinson and heirs counsel on status of Graceland 
negotiations; telephone conference with Stinson and 
heirs counsel on status of Graceland negotiations. 

08/08/16 M. Shea 4.60  Call with Stinson regarding Paisley Park/Graceland 
transaction; telephone call  
investment in Paisley Park and terms of 
Graceland/Paisley Park investment; detailed review of 
Paisley Park proposal and comments by K. Abdo and 
A. Gislason; review various pleadings, correspondence 
and other related documents;  

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

08/08/16 N. Harwood 3.00  (No Charge)  
 

 
08/09/16 B. Dillon 1.10  Confer with D. Crosby on proposed interim motion on 

genetic testing results; confer with Lommen Abdo on 
proposed interim motion and status of negotiations 
with Graceland. 

08/09/16 M. Shea 2.30  Analysis of potential deal points for Paisley 
Park/Graceland transaction; conference with K. Abdo 
and A. Gislason regarding Graceland and Paisley Park 
transaction;  
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December 16, 2016 
Invoice# 734889 

Date 
08/10/16 

08/10/16 

08/11/16 

08/11/16 

Timekeeper 
B. Dillon 

Hours 
2.50 

M. Shea 2.60 

B. Dillon 3.90 

M. Shea 3.60 

Amount Description 
  

confer with Stinson attorneys on status of Paisley 
Park negotiations and genetic testing appointment; 
telephone conferences with petition heirs counsel 
and Stinson on Graceland-Paisley Park negotiations; 
follow up emails regarding same. 

 Review various documents and outlines for Graceland 
transaction; telephone call with counsel for various 
beneficiaries relating to Graceland transaction and 
other matters;  

 prepare for and conduct 
telephone call with Stinson and beneficiary counsel 
relating to Graceland transaction;  

 
 

 Telephone conferences with petition heirs counsel on 
status of Graceland-Paisley Park negotiations, and 

 
 

 review court order on Parentage Act 
issues and excluding certain parties from confidential 
information. 

 Review various notes relating to Paisley Park 
transaction; prepare for and conduct morning 
conference call with counsel relating to Paisley 
Park/Graceland transaction; email correspondence 
with individual attorneys of various petitioned heirs; 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 detailed review of Order 
regarding sale of real estate and Order regarding 
confidentiality. 

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 20 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/12/16 B. Dillon 1.00  Weekly conference call with court and heirs counsel. 
08/12/16 M. Shea 3.80  Review items for call with Court; prepare for and 

conduct telephone call with Court and Bremer 
relating to various estate administration matters; 

 
 

 
 correspondence with counsel 

and advisors relating to Paisley Park deal; prepare for 
and conduct multiple telephone conferences with 
beneficiary counsel relating to various Paisley 
Park/Graceland deal points;  

 
 

08/12/16 N. Harwood 1.50  (No Charge) Participate in court conference call. 
08/15/16 M. Shea 1.10   

review various proposals and iterations of Paisley 
Park document revisions. 

08/16/16 B. Dillon 8.10  Participate in family meeting at Stinson; review 
documents filed in support of motion to approve 
Paisley Park deal with Graceland. 

08/16/16 M. Shea 9.50  Prepare for and attend meeting with Stinson/Bremer 
on  estate administration 
matters;  

 
 

08/17/16 B. Dillon 0.40   
 

08/17/16 M. Shea 0.90   
 

 
08/18/16 A. Coleman 1.50  Conference with M. Shea to discuss various estate 

matters;  

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED
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REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

10-PR-16-46 Filed in First Judicial District Court
2/8/2017 10:08:00 AM

Carver County, MN



-1~ 
- ....JJ...J 

Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 21 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/19/16 B. Dillon 2.00  Confer with M. Shea regarding case status and issues 

to address on behalf of heirs; confer with heirs' 
counsel regarding  

 
 

 
 

 
08/19/16 A. Coleman 1.30  Prepare for and participate on conference call with 

heirs to discuss various open issues. 
08/19/16 N. Harwood 4.00  (No Charge) Participate in Court conference call, 

 
and M. Shea. 

08/21/16 B. Dillon 0.40  Confer with heirs' counsel regarding status of 
discussions with counsel for Brianna and Victoria 
Nelson regarding discovery schedule;  

 
 

08/22/16 B. Dillon 1.75  Confer with with M. Shea, Ken Abdo, and L. Braganza 
and A. Stoltman regarding  
discovery schedule; correspond with heirs group 
regarding same. 

08/22/16 M. Shea 3.70  Review correspondence from petitioned heirs 
regarding proposed discovery plan for B/V Nelson; 
prepare for and conduct telephone conference with 
petitioned heirs' counsel relating to  

 and other related matters;  
 
 
 

 conference call with petitioned 
heirs regarding  

 
08/23/16 J. Anderson 1.40  Analysis of court orders regarding genetic testing and 

penalties for refusal; legal research regarding same; 
draft analysis of points. 

REDACTED
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 22 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount Descri12tion 
08/23/16 B. Dillon 0.40   Petition for Determination of 

Heirs and related discovery issues; review emails on 
Paisley Park developments and press release. 

08/23/16 M. Shea 3.30  Prepare for and conduct telephone call with 
petitioned heirs' relating to  

 
 
 
 

correspondence with petitioned heirs regarding  
 
 

 
08/23/16 H. Malcomson 0.50  Review order regarding genetic testing and discuss 

research with J. Anderson and M. Shea. 
08/24/16 J. Anderson 0.50  Communications regarding genetic testing with team; 

telephone conference with D. Crosby regarding 
genetic testing. 

08/24/16 M. Shea 1.50   
 and other related Paisley Park 

matters;  
 

 
 further 

correspondence regarding Paisley Park press release 
with Special Administrator and petitioned heirs. 

08/25/16 J. Anderson 0.70  Discuss next steps with D. Crosby; update team; find 
research memo on equitable adoption. 
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 23 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/25/16 M. Shea 1.80   

prepare for and 
conduct telephone call with counsel of petitioned 
heirs regarding  

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

compose email to petitioned heirs on  
 

 
 
 

compose email to petitioned heirs on  
 

08/26/16 J. Anderson 2.80   
 

 
08/26/16 B. Dillon 1.20  Telephone calls with heirs counsel and Stinson on 

 
08/26/16 M. Shea 2.60  Prepare for and attend Court conference call relating 

to various matters; attend meeting with advisors 
regarding  

 
 

08/26/16 N. Harwood 3.50  (No Charge)  
 
 
 

08/28/16 B. Dillon 1.60  Call with heirs' counsel regarding  
 

 

REDACTED REDACTED
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 24 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekee12er Hours Amount DescriQtion 
08/28/16 M. Shea 2.30  Prepare for and conduct telephone call with petition 

heirs' counsel regarding  
 

 
08/29/16 J. Anderson 0.30   

 
 

08/29/16 B. Dillon 1.80   
 

confer with heirs counsel, GPM team, and Stinson on 
 

 
08/29/16 M. Shea 5.40   

 
 

 
correspondence with beneficiaries' counsel regarding 
the same; prepare for and conduct meeting with 
Stinson and other beneficiary counsel regarding 

follow-up 
with and beneficiaries' counsel regarding  

 
08/29/16 A. Coleman 2.70   

 
 

 
08/30/16 J. Anderson 6.50   

 
08/30/16 B. Dillon 2.50   

 
confer with heirs group, Stinson and 

Court on  

REDACTED
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Page 25 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/30/16 M. Shea 6.20   

 
 
 

 
prepare and 

conduct telephone call with beneficiaries' counsel 
regarding review 
and revise letter to Court regarding  

 
 

 
conference with 

beneficiaries' counsel regarding  
 

 
08/31/16 J. Anderson 2.00   

 
 

 
08/31/16 B. Dillon 1.60  Edit and revise opposition to motion for 

reconsideration,  
 

 

08/31/16 M. Shea 1.70   
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

08/31/16 A. Coleman 2.30   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 26 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
08/31/16 N. Harwood 3.00  (No Charge)  

 
 

 
09/01/16 B. Dillon 0.50  Confer with K. Abdo on issues pertaining to  

 
work on brief 

opposing motion for clarification or reconsideration 
by B/V Nelson and confer with heirs group regarding 
same;  

 
09/01/16 A. Coleman 0.80   

 
09/02/16 J. Anderson 0.40  Review correspondence among attorneys regarding 

response to motion for reconsideration; review edits 
to motion for reconsideration; review court's order 
regarding schedule. 

09/02/16 B. Dillon 3.90  Telephone conference with Court, Stinson and heirs 
counsel regarding estate administration issues, 
including B/V Nelson claims, Fee Petition,  

and follow up call with heirs 
counsel regarding same;  

 
 

 
09/06/16 B. Dillon 4.40  Emails and telephone conference with counsel for 

heirs group on  
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 27 Invoice# 734889 

Date TimekeeQer Hours Amount DescriQtion 
09/06/16 M. Shea 2.30   

 
 

 
 

 prepare for and conduct call with 
heirs' counsel relating to  

 
 analysis of other related estate 

adminstration matters. 
09/07/16 B. Dillon 3.10  Emails and telephone conference with counsel for 

heirs group on  
 

 revise letter to Stinson outlining 
 

 telephone conference with Lommen 
Abdo team regarding same;  

 
 

09/07/16 M. Shea 2.30  Prepare for and conduct telephone call with 
petitioned heirs regarding  

 
 

 
 

correspondence with petitioned heir counsel 
regarding  review 
payment deadlines for estate taxes. 

09/08/16 B. Dillon 3.50  Telephone conferences and emails with heirs group 
counsel regarding  

 
 edit letter to the 

court regarding same. 
09/08/16 B. Mooty 0.40   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 28 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
09/08/16 M. Shea 3.40  Analysis of upcoming meeting with special 

adminstrator and Court;  
 

 
 prepare for and 

conduct call with petition heirs' counsel relating to 
 

 review and revise letter to the 
Court;  begin 
preparation for Court conference tomorrow. 

09/09/16 B. Dillon 9.50  Prepare for and attend meeting at Carver County 
Court regarding  

 
09/09/16 B. Mooty 2.00   

 
 

09/09/16 M. Shea 10.20  Prepare for and attend  conference at the 
Carver County Courthouse;  

 
 

 
 

 
 meet and confer with 

petitioners' counsel and heirs relating to  
 

 
09/10/16 B. Mooty 2.00   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 29 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
09/10/16 M. Shea 1.30   

 
 

 
 

 
 

correspondence with 
presumptive heirs' counsel regarding next steps for 
special administration. 

09/11/16 B. Dillon 0.30  Emails with heirs group on issues to address following 
meeting  

09/11/16 B. Mooty 1.00   
 

09/11/16 M. Shea 0.60   
 
 

09/12/16 B. Dillon 2.60  Confer with heirs counsel on dispute  
 

 
 

 
 

 
09/12/16 B. Mooty 1.50   

 
09/12/16 M. Shea 2.20   

 
calls with counsel regarding 

 
 

09/13/16 J. Anderson 1.40   
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Page 31 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeger Hours Amount Descrigtion 
09/16/16 B. Dillon 5.30  Telephone conference with the Court regarding 

 
 

 
09/16/16 M. Shea 5.00   

 
 

 prepare for and attend weekly call with the 
Court;  

 
 

 
 

 
09/16/16 N. Harwood 6.00  (No Charge)  

 
 

 
 

 
 

09/17/16 B. Dillon 3.00   
 

09/17/16 M. Shea 2.50   calls 
with counsel and correspondence with client 
regarding the same;  

 
 call with K. 

Abdo and S. Silton relating to  
 

 
09/18/16 B. Dillon 3.00   

 
09/18/16 M. Shea 0.50   

 
09/19/16 J. Anderson 0.60   
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Page 32 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
09/19/16 B. Dillon 5.70   

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
09/19/16 M. Shea 0.80   

 
 

 
. 

09/20/16 J. Anderson 0.60   
 

 
09/20/16 B. Dillon 12.90  Attend to  including 

numerous telephone conferences with Stinson and 
heirs group counsel over  

 
 

 
telephone conferences with heirs group counsel and 
support staff on strategy. 

09/20/16 M. Shea 3.40   
 review and revise memoradnum; calls with 

counsel relating to objections;  
 
 

 

09/20/16 A. Coleman 1.60   
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 33 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
09/20/16 M. Martin 1.30   

 
09/21/16 J. Anderson 4.60   

 
 

09/21/16 B. Dillon 5.80  Attend to dispute over  including follow 
up correspondence with the Court, Stinson, and heirs 
group counsel on order extending deadlines and 
filings under seal;  

 strategize with 
heirs group counsel regarding  

 
 
 

 
 

09/21/16 M. Shea 1.80   
 call with counsel 

regarding  
 

 
09/21/16 A. Coleman 0.40   

 
09/22/16 J. Anderson 2.90   
09/22/16 B. Dillon 0.10   

 
09/22/16 M. Shea 0.60   

 
 

 
09/22/16 K. Narveson 0.20   

 
 

09/23/16 J. Anderson 4.20   

REDACTED
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Nelson, Tyka December 16, 2016 
Page 34 Invoice# 734889 

Date Timekeeger Hours Amount Descrigtion 
09/23/16 B. Dillon 6.70  Participate in telephone conference with Court and 

follow up conference with heirs counsel regarding 
 
 
 

 
   

 
 

09/23/16 M. Shea 1.80  Consider weekly call with Court; calls with counsel for 
heirs;  

 
   

 
09/23/16 N. Harwood 8.00  (No Charge)  

 
 
 

 
09/24/16 B. Dillon 3.50   

   
 

 
 

09/25/16 B. Dillon 1.75   
  

 
 

 
09/25/16 M. Shea 2.20   
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Date Timekeeper Hours Amount Description 
09/26/16 B. Dillon 4.00   

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
09/26/16 M. Shea 1.20   

 
09/26/16 A. Coleman 0.40   

 
09/27/16 B. Dillon 1.30  Confer with heirs group on  

 
 

 
 

09/28/16 B. Dillon 0.40   
09/29/16 B. Dillon 0.80   

 
10/11/16 B. Dillon 0.60   
10/11/16 M. Shea 0.20   

 
10/17/16 M. Shea 1.00  Telephone call with R. Barton regarding upcoming 

hearing and other related estate administration 
matters. 

10/18/16 M. Shea 1.60   
 

 confer with B. 
Dillon regarding various estate administration 
matters. 

11/08/16 B. Dillon 0.30  Confer with R. Barton regarding case status and 
personal representative issues. 

11/09/16 M. Shea 0.40  Correspondence with counsel regarding personal 
representative considerations. 

REDACTED
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Nelson, Tyka 
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Date Timekeei::1er 
11/17/16 B. Dillon 

11/22/16 B. Dillon 

11/22/16 A. Coleman 

11/23/16 B. Dillon 

11/23/16 A. Coleman 

11/29/16 B. Dillon 

Hours Amount 
0.40  

0.20  

0.80  

0.20  

2.40  

December 16, 2016 
Invoice# 734889 

DescriQtion 
Confer with R. Barton on personal representative 
considerations. 
Confer with A. Coleman on research personal 
representative considerations. 
Begin review of Minnesota Limited Purpose Trust 
Company statutes. 
Confer with A. Coleman on personal representative 
issues. 
Conclude review and analysis of Minnesota Limited 
Purpose Trust Company statutes; call with B. Dillon to 
relay findings. 

0.40  Confer with R. Barton regarding personal 
representative considerations. 

Total Hours  

Total for Services $  

Other Charges 

DescriQtion 
 

 
 

Total Other Charges 

Total This Statement 

Amount 
 

(  
 

$  

$  

REDACTED
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December 16, 2016 
Invoice# 734889 

Summary by Time Recorder 
Time Recorder Hours Hourly Bill 

Billed Rate Amount 
Susan Gaertner 1.10   
Matthew Shea 180.40   
Sarah Duniway 0.70   
Brian Dillon 242.90   
Alfred Coleman 14.20   
Joy Anderson 30.60   
Brianna Mooty 6.90   
Richard Landon 1.20   
Holly Malcomson 15.90   
Meg Martin 1.30   
Christopher McGreevy 0.20   
Krista Narveson 0.20   
Nevin Harwood 68.95   
Total Services 564.55  

Total This Statement $  
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