

STATE OF MINNESOTA  
COUNTY OF CARVER

DISTRICT COURT  
FIRST JUDICIAL DISTRICT  
PROBATE DIVISION

In Re:

Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson,  
Decedent.

Case Type: Special Administration  
Court File No.: 10-PR-16-46  
Judge: Kevin W. Eide

**REDACTED**

**AFFIDAVIT OF STEVEN H. SILTON IN  
SUPPORT OF OMARR BAKER'S  
MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF PAYMENT  
OF ATTORNEYS' FEES THROUGH  
JANUARY 31, 2017**

STATE OF MINNESOTA )  
 ) ss.  
COUNTY OF HENNEPIN )

Steven H. Silton, after being duly sworn, states:

1. I am an attorney duly licensed to practice and in good standing in the State of Minnesota. If called as a witness, I could and would competently testify to the facts stated herein based on my own personal knowledge.
2. I am an attorney at Cozen O'Connor ("Cozen"), counsel of record for Omarr Baker. I make this affidavit in support of Omarr Baker's Motion for Approval of Payment of Attorneys' Fees through January 31, 2017.
3. Omarr Baker ("Baker") retained Cozen in June 2016 to provide legal services and specialized advice regarding the Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson (the "Estate"). Cozen formally appeared in the matter on June 23, 2016. A true and accurate copy of the invoice for which Baker now seeks payment from the Estate, which related to the services that benefitted the Estate as a whole, is attached as **Exhibit A**. Through his Motion, Baker is

not seeking reimbursement from the Estate for services that arguably benefitted Baker individually—but rather, for services that benefitted the Estate as a whole.

4. By Order entered on September 30, 2016, the Court [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]
5. By Order entered on October 6, 2016 (the “Order”) the Court [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]
6. During much of the time period covered by this Application, I corresponded extensively with the Representatives, counsel for Bremer, and counsel for the other Non-Excluded Heirs regarding [REDACTED]
7. Limited drafts of [REDACTED] were provided to the Non-Excluded Heirs, and comments were to be provided on an expedited basis. Thus, I relied on other Cozen attorneys to assist in our analysis of proposed agreements, particularly to assess [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]
8. I, along with other attorneys at Cozen, engaged in frequent communications with counsel for the other Non-Excluded Heirs, the Representatives, the Special Administrator, and the Special Administrator’s Entertainment Advisors (the “Advisors”) to offer input and assist

in negotiating amendments to the deals in order to provide status updates and prepare strategy.

9. On November 9, 2016, Mr. Abdo and his firm withdrew from the underlying litigation, and Frank K. Wheaton, counsel to Alfred Jackson, replaced him as the other Representative for the Non-Excluded Heirs.
10. I am well-qualified to provide counsel in the realm of entertainment law, based on my more than 20 years' experience in entertainment law, including serving as an Advisory Board member of the University of Miami School Sports and Entertainment Law LLM.
11. My colleague Jeffrey Kolodny is also well-qualified to serve as counsel in these proceedings. Mr. Kolodny practices on complex international and domestic estate planning and administration, with a focus on wealth preservation through effective tax planning, structuring and personal planning for high net worth individuals and multinational families.
12. To assist in the briefing for matters that required the Court's attention, Cozen professional Thomas Kane was primarily involved, although other timekeepers were utilized as reasonable and appropriate. Mr. Kane has extensive experience litigating high profile, complex litigation, and his knowledge and experience provided immense benefit to the Estate.
13. From December 1, 2016 through January 31, 2017, I, with the assistance of other Cozen attorneys, provided a variety of services to the Estate which significantly improved the long-form agreements and which provided greater involvement by the Non-Excluded Heirs in the negotiating process. This work included:

- Participating in dozens of telephonic conferences and preparing hundreds of emails to achieve a consensus regarding the [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]

- Meeting with the Estate’s Advisors, participating in many telephone conferences and exchanging dozens of email with the Estate’s Advisors and with the Special Administrator’s counsel regarding the family’s position with respect to certain deals.

Cozen further assessed costs related to

[REDACTED]

14. In providing legal services sought by this Motion, Cozen attorneys and paralegals have expended 800.90 hours from December 1, 2016 through January 31, 2017. Due to attorney-client privilege and attorney work product protection, redacted billing statements are filed publicly with this Motion. Cozen’s unredacted time records have been provided for the Court’s review.

15. From December 1, 2016 through January 31, 2017, attorneys at Cozen performed services that were reasonably and necessarily incurred to secure the right of the Representatives to participate in the negotiation and finalizing [REDACTED]

Such services performed by Cozen for the benefit of the Estate have included but have not been limited to the following tasks:

**Preparing Comments and Developing Consensus for Certain Entertainment Deals**

16. Cozen attorneys conferred with the Representatives to reach a consensus among counsel for all Non-Excluded Heirs. Upon developing a consensus, the Representatives provided [REDACTED] to the Advisors for [REDACTED]
17. The Representatives also met with Advisors to discuss [REDACTED]. Following those meetings, I—along with counsel for the other Non-Excluded Heirs—engaged in many telephone calls, emails, exchanges of information and re-drafts of the entertainment deals over several weeks.
18. As a result of these efforts, the final version of [REDACTED] are materially better for the Estate than [REDACTED]
19. During this process, I and other Cozen attorneys engaged in frequent conversations and email exchanges with other counsel for the other Non-Excluded Heirs, with counsel for the Special Administrator, and with the Advisors to offer comments, to assist in negotiating amendments to the deals, and to obtain agreement on a joint strategy.
20. Cozen's efforts resulted in [REDACTED] and provided material benefits to the Estate.
21. These efforts benefitted the Estate, by again confirming the role of the Representatives in the negotiation process, and providing a level of certainty to the Non-Excluded Heirs and the Estate's partners that the proposed deals served the best interests of the Estate. Baker now seeks reimbursement from the Estate for those efforts.

22. In my opinion, the Cozen time is sought for reimbursement for efforts related to the proposed entertainment deals is just and reasonable and commensurate with the benefit to the Estate.
23. Cozen's legal fees are in the total amount of \$354,258.00 for services sought by this Motion. I and other attorneys at Cozen have reviewed the original time entries for the legal fees submitted by Cozen and affirm that the work was actually performed for the benefit of the Estate, was necessary for the proper administration of the Estate, and that the fees are reasonable given (1) the time and labor required; (2) the complexity and novelty of the transactions involved; and (3) the extent of the responsibilities assumed and the results obtained. The coordination of work required over several sophisticated and complex disciplines, and the time demands required finds the pending fee request reasonable under these unique circumstances. Furthermore, our firm's hourly rates and overall charges are fair when compared against the fees charged for comparable work for similar firms in other major metropolitan areas.
24. Given the complexity of the litigation, the entertainment deals the Estate is negotiating, and the results achieved, \$354,258.00 is a just and reasonable amount to request.
25. Costs advanced to be reimbursed total \$15,847.61.

FURTHER YOUR AFFIANT SAYETH NOT.

Dated: March 3, 2017

/s/ Steven H. Silton  
Steven H. Silton

Subscribed and sworn to before me  
this 3rd day of March, 2017.

/s/ Amy E. Kulbeik  
Notary Public

# EXHIBIT A



March 3, 2017

Baker, Omarr  
[REDACTED]

Re: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson  
Our File No.: 390086.000

|                                 |                     |
|---------------------------------|---------------------|
| Fees for Professional Services: | \$354,258.00        |
| Expenses Incurred:              | \$8,447.61          |
| <b>Total Amount of Invoice:</b> | <b>\$362,705.61</b> |

**Total Amount due upon receipt of bill**

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 200603.2694.000 Baker, Omarr  
390086.000 Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson

| Date     | Initials | Description of Services   | Hours |
|----------|----------|---|-------|
| 12/01/16 | AEK      | Review and update docket.   | 0.70  |
| 12/01/16 | SHS      | Review potential [REDACTED] multiple conferences regarding same; analyze issues regarding [REDACTED] analyze next steps regarding same  | 7.90  |
| 12/02/16 | AEK      | Update docket.  | 0.40  |
| 12/02/16 | JBK      | Telephone conf. w/S. Silton. Tconf w/M. Lythcott re: [REDACTED]   | 1.20  |
| 12/02/16 | SHS      | Review petition regarding [REDACTED] numerous phone calls regarding same; review next steps (4.5) analyzed issues regarding same; review existing deal; analyzed same (3.8)   | 8.30  |
| 12/05/16 | SHS      | Reviewed issues regarding music deal; review status of [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same (3.1); Review issues regarding new [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding [REDACTED] (1.9); Telephone conference w/ F. Wheaton and L. McMillan (2.3)   | 7.30  |
| 12/06/16 | AEK      | Review filed pleadings; review court and firm dockets.  | 0.50  |
| 12/06/16 | SHS      | Telephone conference with counsel; review petition to appoint PR; review [REDACTED] analyze whether [REDACTED]  | 5.80  |
| 12/07/16 | AEK      | Exchange emails regarding hearing confirmation; review court docket.  | 0.40  |
| 12/07/16 | AFM      | Draft petition for successor special administrator. Draft petition for personal representative. Draft Acceptances of Appointment for successor special administrator and personal administrator for Comerica. Draft Acceptance of Appointment for personal administrator for Van Jones. Meet with Comerica representative for signature. Compose email to Van Jones for signature. Correspond with T. Kane, S. Silton, and J. Kolodny regarding same. | 6.90  |
| 12/07/16 | JBK      | Working on petition appointing [REDACTED]   | 1.70  |
| 12/07/16 | SHS      | Review issues regarding [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same; prepare for hearing; telephone conference with multiple counsel; telephone conference with client; review [REDACTED] review status of [REDACTED]  | 7.50  |
| 12/07/16 | TPK      | Address issues regarding petitions for PR.  | 0.90  |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 3

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 12/08/16    | AEK             | Review petitions for filing; exchange emails regarding same; review e-mail regarding docketing; docket petition deadline on firm docket  | 1.70         |
| 12/08/16    | AFM             | Compose email to A. Kulbeik regarding petitions to file.   | 0.20         |
| 12/08/16    | AFM             | Review petitions filed by non-excluded heirs. Review and revise Baker petitions.   | 2.00         |
| 12/08/16    | SHS             | Travel to and attend hearing re: ██████ request for relief; analyze issues regarding continued service of Bremer; review issues regarding claims of ██████ impact on ██████ review issues regarding same     | 7.10         |
| 12/08/16    | TPK             | Attend hearing re: ██████ request for relief.  | 2.50         |
| 12/09/16    | AEK             | Review emails regarding status; review petitions.  | 0.70         |
| 12/09/16    | AFM             | Review signed Acceptance of Appointment from Van Jones. Compose email to S. Silton, T. Kane, and J. Kolodny regarding same.  | 0.20         |
| 12/09/16    | SHS             | Review issues regarding petition; numerous calls regarding same; review issues regarding same; telenhone conference with client; telephone conference with ██████  | 7.40         |
| 12/09/16    | TPK             | Attend conference with court and draft status report.  | 1.50         |
| 12/10/16    | AFM             | Review and revise petitions for successor special administrator and personal representative.   | 5.50         |
| 12/11/16    | SHS             | Telephone conference with client; review issues regarding ██████ analyze issues regarding managing matter  | 2.90         |
| 12/12/16    | AEK             | Review petitions; research on Federal Court cases for ██████ exchange emails with T. Kane regarding same.  | 2.10         |
| 12/12/16    | AFM             | Review and revise petitions for successor special administrator and personal representative. Compose email to S. Silton regarding same.  | 0.90         |
| 12/12/16    | AFM             | Review Holland & Knight motion to approve attorneys' fees. Review statutes and case law in memoranda. Research case law regarding ██████   | 7.60         |
| 12/12/16    | SHS             | Review ██████ issues; review issues regarding corporate fiduciary; analyze issues regarding same; attend to multiple emails; telephone conference with client; review issues regarding petition; revise same | 7.50         |
| 12/12/16    | TPK             | Address Cozen fee petition issues.   | 0.90         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 4

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>  | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|---|--------------|
| 12/13/16    | AEK             | Review emails regarding Holland and Knight fees; review petitions; notarize same; serve and electronically file petitions and acceptances with the Court.   | 2.20         |
| 12/13/16    | AFM             | Compose email to J. Kolodny, S. Silton, and T. Kane regarding Holland & Knight's motions for attorneys' fees.   | 0.30         |
| 12/13/16    | AFM             | Draft notice of motion and motion to approve non-entertainment fees, memorandum in support, affidavit of T. Kane in support, and proposed order. Compose email to J. Kolodny, S. Silton, and T. Kane regarding same.  | 4.60         |
| 12/13/16    | AFM             | Draft notice of motion and motion to approve entertainment fees, memorandum in support, affidavit of S. Silton in support, and proposed order. Compose email to J. Kolodny, S. Silton, and T. Kane regarding same.  | 4.60         |
| 12/13/16    | AFM             | Call with S. Silton regarding petitions for successor special administrator and personal representative. Compose email regarding same. Draft Notice and Order for Hearing regarding personal representative. Compose email to S. Silton, T. Kane, and J. Kolodny regarding same.          | 2.10         |
| 12/13/16    | EGR             | Conference w/ A. Mistry regarding Holland Knight motion for attorneys fees and review related court pleadings, statutory law and emails   | 3.50         |
| 12/13/16    | JBK             | Correspondence. Review court documents and court orders.  | 0.50         |
| 12/13/16    | SHS             | Review petition; analyze same; meeting with client; review potential PR; multiple calls regarding same.   | 8.40         |
| 12/13/16    | TPK             | Prepare Cozen fee petition.   | 1.20         |
| 12/14/16    | AEK             | Review filed pleadings and review of docket deadlines.  | 0.80         |
| 12/14/16    | AFM             | Review Cozen legal bills and categorize fees for motions to approve attorneys' fees.  | 4.70         |
| 12/14/16    | AFM             | Call with J. Kolodny regarding motions to approve attorneys' fees. Correspond with T. Kane regarding motions to approve attorneys' fees. Review and revise motions to approve attorneys' fees, incorporating edits from J. Kolodny and T. Kane. Correspond with S. Silton regarding same. | 5.90         |
| 12/14/16    | EGR             | Review and analyze Baker motions for payment of attorneys fees related to entertainment and nonentertainment expenses   | 1.60         |
| 12/14/16    | JBK             | Review court documents. Telephone conf. w/S.Silton. Analysis.   | 2.30         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 5

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 12/14/16    | SHS             | Review issues regarding PR; telephone conference with R. Sayers; telephone conference with client; analyze issues regarding same; review [REDACTED] review email from Stinson; review [REDACTED]                   | 8.40         |
| 12/15/16    | AEK             | Review of filed documents; review docket and response for fees.  | 0.90         |
| 12/15/16    | AFM             | Review legal bill and categorize entries. Review Special Administrator's request for fees and Holland & Knight's request for fees. Analyze case law regarding requests for attorneys' fees.                        | 6.90         |
| 12/15/16    | AFM             | Review and revise motions to approve attorneys' fees. Review and revise affidavits of S. Silton and T. Kane to incorporate information regarding [REDACTED]  | 7.90         |
| 12/15/16    | SHS             | Review [REDACTED] review issues regarding same; review issues with potential PR's; analyze issues regarding same   | 7.40         |
| 12/16/16    | AEK             | Review of motion for fees and filed pleadings; review email regarding extension; conference with M. Pocock regarding same; exchange emails regarding charts for fees; review affidavits.                           | 2.20         |
| 12/16/16    | EGR             | Review revised drafts of motions for [REDACTED] fees and related documents   | 2.00         |
| 12/16/16    | SHS             | Review [REDACTED] telephone conference with G. Sikorski; Review numerous issues regarding PR; multiple telephone conferences regarding same; review email from R. Sayers; review petition; draft modified petition | 8.80         |
| 12/16/16    | TPK             | Address Cozen fee petition and address issues raised by [REDACTED] in complaint..  | 0.90         |
| 12/19/16    | AEK             | Exchange emails regarding Bremer discharge; exchange emails regarding [REDACTED] review file materials regarding same.   | 0.60         |
| 12/19/16    | JBK             | Work on issues related to accounting of Bremer and considering objections to that. Telephone conf. w/ S. Silton. Review court documents. Consider [REDACTED]   | 1.40         |
| 12/19/16    | TPK             | Analysis of filings by Nelsons by Hansen Dordell   | 0.40         |
| 12/20/16    | AEK             | Review filed pleadings; review docket; conference with M. Pocock regarding re-filing acceptances and petitions; review filing; conferences with T. Kane regarding same.  | 2.10         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 6

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 12/20/16    | EGR             | Conclude review and analysis of [REDACTED] and draft correspondence summarizing analysis;  | 3.20         |
| 12/20/16    | JBK             | Consideration of accounting issues related to Bremer final and account related matters.  | 1.80         |
| 12/20/16    | SHS             | Review status of PR; review issues with Comerica alone; analyze contractual issues related to the same; review other options; telephone conference w/ K. Warren regarding his status.  | 4.20         |
| 12/20/16    | TPK             | Address Carver County clerks' request for refile of document not under seal.   | 0.40         |
| 12/21/16    | SHS             | Review status of [REDACTED] review issue, regarding [REDACTED]   | 3.50         |
| 12/22/16    | AEK             | Review filings with the Court.   | 1.30         |
| 12/22/16    | EGR             | Review and analyze Lommen Abdo petition for fees, Abdo affidavit and related emails; conf w/ T Kane re: petition; review and respond to emails with A Mistry re: petition  | 2.50         |
| 12/22/16    | SHS             | Review issues regarding [REDACTED] telephone conference with client; review issues regarding same; email regarding same.   | 2.10         |
| 12/22/16    | TPK             | Review Stinson fees objections and petitions.  | 0.50         |
| 12/23/16    | AFM             | Review and revise request for [REDACTED] Compose email to E. Rapoport regarding same.  | 4.40         |
| 12/23/16    | EGR             | Review and analyze Nelson heir objections to Baker and Tyka motion filings; review Baker petition and [REDACTED] review and respond to emails w/ A Mistry  | 2.00         |
| 12/23/16    | JBK             | Review court documents.  | 0.20         |
| 12/23/16    | SHS             | Review status [REDACTED] telephone conference with Michael Lythcott re same.   | 3.10         |
| 12/23/16    | TPK             | Review objection by Nelsons to legal fees of Lommen Abdo   | 0.60         |
| 12/23/16    | TPK             | Review the fee petition by Lommen Abdo.  | 0.30         |
| 12/27/16    | SHS             | Review status of accounting; analyze issues regarding same; reviewed status of PR; analyzed issues regarding same; telephone conference with Comerica; multiple calls with counsel; call with client; reviewed issues re: representation; [REDACTED] | 5.20         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 7

| Date     | Initials | Description of Services  | Hours |
|----------|----------|--|-------|
| 12/28/16 | JBK      | Telephone conf. w/S. Silton and M. Lythcott re: [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED] Email correspondence re:<br>petition for accounting, objections, issues re: accounting,<br>and drafting objections to accounting petition.  | 3.90  |
| 12/28/16 | SHS      | Review status [REDACTED], review issue with [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED] (3.1). Review status of PR; telephone conference<br>with multiple counsel; analyze issues regarding corporate<br>structure; review ways in which [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED] (3.1). Review accounting; analyze<br>issues regarding objection; review issues regarding<br>potential objections (1.8). | 4.90  |
| 12/28/16 | TPK      | Prepare strategy for objection to final accounting, various<br>emails setting forth strategy to counsel  | 1.50  |
| 12/29/16 | JBK      | Telephone conf. w/counsel re: choice of a co-personal<br>representative.   | 1.00  |
| 12/29/16 | SHS      | Review issues regarding PR; review issues regarding<br>[REDACTED] telephone conference with A.<br>Aycock; analyze issues regarding same; Telephone<br>conference w/ J. Weinshanker; analyze issues regarding<br>same; telephone counsel with counsel regarding ongoing<br>issues.  | 6.90  |
| 12/29/16 | TPK      | Prepare motions for Cozen fees   | 0.40  |
| 12/30/16 | JBK      | Email with S. Silton re: subpoena for information from<br>McMillan in connection with possible appointment of<br>McMillan.   | 0.60  |
| 12/30/16 | TPK      | Address fees- analyze language for brief re fees   | 0.80  |
| 01/02/17 | JBK      | Email correspondence w/S. Silton re: issues related to<br>appointment of PR, etc.  | 0.20  |
| 01/03/17 | EGR      | Review and analyze Gray Plant Mooty Motion for Fees,<br>related affidavits and exhibits; review and analyze amended<br>Lommen Abdo motion for fees, related affidavits and<br>exhibits; review corresponding court orders and emails   | 4.00  |
| 01/03/17 | JBK      | Consideration of issues discussed with client re: [REDACTED]<br>etc. Confs w/M. Mallol re: legal research re: [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED] Consideration of issues related to<br>[REDACTED] Email<br>correspondence re: this and other issues. Prep for telephone<br>conf w/Comerica. Extensive telephone conf w/Comerica  | 5.40  |
| 01/03/17 | MM       | Research and summarize research for J. Kolodny re: [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED]  | 5.00  |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 8

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/03/17    | SHS             | Reviewed status of ongoing claims; reviewed emails regarding same; Reviewed status of potential PRs; telephone conference with client and opposing counsel re: same; reviewed next steps; analyzed contractual restrictions on service; reviewed legal issues; regarding contractual limitations   | 6.50         |
| 01/04/17    | AEK             | Review strategy emails; catch up on docketing and review of pleadings  | 1.20         |
| 01/04/17    | AFM             | Draft motion for continuance of deadline to object to Special Administrator's accounting. Correspond with J. Kolodny, T. Kane, and S. Siltan regarding same. Draft document requests, notice of motion, and proposed order.  | 2.60         |
| 01/04/17    | AFM             | Draft motion to compel [REDACTED]  | 3.40         |
| 01/04/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze Inventory of Estate and Final Accounting filed by Bremer Trust; review Tyka Nelson substitution of counsel; review [REDACTED] conference with A Mistry regarding case status  | 2.00         |
| 01/04/17    | JBK             | Contact and telephone conf's w/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Email correspondence re: same. Review of court documents including accounting and inventory and analysis and consideration thereof. Consideration of objections to accounting. Telephone conf w/S. Siltan, T. Kane re: next steps in preparation for 1/12 court hearing. Consideration of subpoena or motion for information from [REDACTED] | 5.00         |
| 01/04/17    | SHS             | Review next steps regarding PR; review hearing and related issues; review potential objections; review issues  | 5.80         |
| 01/04/17    | TPK             | Draft letter to [REDACTED] re: request for information.  | 0.60         |
| 01/04/17    | TPK             | Draft motion for extension and motion to produce documents and address strategy regarding accounting   | 0.90         |
| 01/05/17    | AEK             | Review motion and accompanying documents for extension of time to file opposition to petition for order approving accounting; serve and electronically file motion for extension of time to file opposition with the Court; communications regarding same.   | 2.10         |
| 01/05/17    | AFM             | Review and revise motion to compel [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review and revise notice of motion and motion, exhibits, and proposed order.  | 4.50         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 9

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/05/17    | AFM             | Review and revise motion for continuance regarding Special Administrator's accounting. Draft notice of motion and proposed order. Exchange correspondence with S. Siltan and J. Kolodny regarding same.  | 3.40         |
| 01/05/17    | AFM             | Review attorneys' fees invoices filed by Stinson. Compose email to S. Siltan and T. Kane regarding same.   | 0.50         |
| 01/05/17    | JBK             | Review of accounting. [REDACTED] Work on and review of court filings, including continuance for accounting and request for information from [REDACTED]<br>[REDACTED] Prep for court hearing.   | 5.40         |
| 01/05/17    | SHS             | Review [REDACTED] to finalize same; review next steps; review open deals   | 5.40         |
| 01/05/17    | TPK             | Call regarding Comerica's appointment.   | 1.00         |
| 01/06/17    | AEK             | Review and update service list; conference with M. Pocock regarding same; conference with M. Pocock regarding filing under seal; review [REDACTED] and accompanying documents; serve and electronically file [REDACTED] redact Cozen fees; conference with A. Mistry regarding redactions; review email from A. Mistry regarding redactions; communications regarding response to Lommen's fees; serve and electronically file response to Lommen fees with the Court. | 2.70         |
| 01/06/17    | AFM             | Draft response to Lommen Abdo's petition for fees. Correspond with T. Kane and S. Siltan regarding same.   | 0.50         |
| 01/06/17    | AFM             | Draft memorandum in support of appointing Van Jones as personal representative. Draft affidavit of Van Jones and affidavit of Omarr Baker. Correspond with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] Correspond with M. Mallol regarding [REDACTED]  | 7.70         |
| 01/06/17    | AFM             | Review and revise exhibits to attach to motion to compel re: [REDACTED] Correspond with S. Siltan and A. Kulbeik regarding same.   | 1.10         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 10

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/06/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze motions filed by O Baker, T Nelson for extension of time to file objections to petitions for fees and corresponding proposed order; review and analyze special administrator's response to petitions for fees, review and analyze S Nelson, N Nelson, J Nelson objection to petitions for fees and related affidavits; review and analyze O Baker and T Nelson [REDACTED] for production of documents and related affidavit and proposed order, review and analyze special administrator letter to court in support of [REDACTED] petition for allowance of a claim; petitioner reply to the special administrator's objection to the petition for allowance of claim and related affidavits; | 3.00         |
| 01/06/17    | JBK             | Telephone conf. w/Court and Bremer. Prep for court appearance on 1/12 for issues related to [REDACTED] etc.  | 4.40         |
| 01/06/17    | MM              | Research regarding accounting and PR, draft memo re: same.   | 7.00         |
| 01/06/17    | SHS             | Review issues regarding Comerica as PR; review need for information from [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding [REDACTED] legal research regarding same.   | 7.20         |
| 01/06/17    | TPK             | Attend hearing with the court  | 1.00         |
| 01/06/17    | TPK             | Conference with counsel re preparation for hearing   | 0.90         |
| 01/06/17    | TPK             | Draft petition for Jones to be PR.   | 0.50         |
| 01/07/17    | AFM             | Review and revise memorandum in support of appointing V. Jones as personal representative. [REDACTED]<br>Review and revise affidavit of V. Jones. Correspond with S. Siltan regarding same.  | 6.90         |
| 01/08/17    | AFM             | Continue to review and revise memorandum in support of appointing V. Jones as personal representative, incorporating information from [REDACTED] Review and revise affidavit of Van Jones. Correspond with S. Siltan and Phaedra Ellis-Lamkins regarding same.   | 7.20         |
| 01/08/17    | JBK             | Analysis of accounting for estate and entities filed by Bremer in preparation for hearing on 1/12. Legal analysis and consideration of objections to accounting and arguments for court.   | 4.10         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 11

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/09/17    | AFM             | Draft objection to [REDACTED] appointment as personal representative. Correspond with S. Silton regarding same. Draft affidavit of S. Silton in support of objection. Review exhibits to attach to affidavit.        | 3.10         |
| 01/09/17    | AFM             | Correspond with Phaedra Ellis-Lamkins regarding memo in support of V. Jones as personal representative. Draft emails requesting affidavits in support.   | 0.50         |
| 01/09/17    | AFM             | Review and revise memo in support of V. Jones as personal representative. Correspond with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]. Revise draft affidavit of Van Jones.  | 3.40         |
| 01/09/17    | AFM             | Draft reply in support of motion for [REDACTED].<br>Draft affidavit of S. Silton and compile exhibits. Correspond with S. Silton and T. Kane regarding same.   | 3.70         |
| 01/09/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze affidavit of R. Savers and corresponding [REDACTED] special administrator motion modify O Baker [REDACTED] special administrator request for commissions; conference with A Mistry regarding same | 1.30         |
| 01/09/17    | JBK             | Preparation for court hearing on 1/12. Preparation of objections to accounting. Review and correspondence. Telephone conf. w/S. Silton re: issues related to hearing and accounting objections.                      | 6.90         |
| 01/09/17    | MM              | Legal analysis, correspondence re PR appointment, analyze Minnesota case law   | 2.50         |
| 01/09/17    | SHS             | Review issues regarding 1/12 hearing; analyze issues regarding same; review next steps; review issues regarding same   | 3.10         |
| 01/09/17    | TPK             | Prepare for 1/12 hearing.  | 0.90         |
| 01/09/17    | TPK             | Draft brief regarding objections to [REDACTED]   | 1.50         |
| 01/10/17    | AEK             | Docket case deadlines: re-file motion for continuance and [REDACTED] telephone conferences with court regarding same; review pleadings for file and hearing.   | 3.20         |
| 01/10/17    | AFM             | Review and revise objection to [REDACTED]. Correspond with S. Silton, T. Kane, and M. Pocock regarding same.   | 2.80         |
| 01/10/17    | AFM             | Review and revise reply in support of [REDACTED] produce documents to determine his suitability. Correspond with S. Silton and T. Kane regarding same.   | 3.10         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 12

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/10/17    | AFM             | Review and revise memo in support of V. Jones as personal representative. Review and revise affidavits of O. Baker and T. Nelson in support. Draft affidavit of S. Silton in support. Compose update regarding requested affidavits.   | 4.10         |
| 01/10/17    | AFM             | Compose email to V. Jones attaching latest version of memo and affidavit in support of Van Jones as personal representative.   | 0.20         |
| 01/10/17    | EGR             | Review [REDACTED] O Baker motion for extension of time to file objections to SA accounting; mtn for L McMillan to produce information and related affidavits, orders; Barron petition allowance for a claim previously disallowed; motion in support of joint petition for general administration of estate.   | 2.00         |
| 01/10/17    | JBK             | Travel to Minneapolis. Working on objections to accounting of Bremer. Confs w/T. Kane. Analysis and review of various documents to be filed. Email correspondence re: issues related to hearing [REDACTED] etc.  | 7.50         |
| 01/10/17    | MM              | Correspondence w/ J. Kolodny re: PR appointment  | 0.80         |
| 01/10/17    | SHS             | Review issues for 1/12 hearing; review discharge and related issues; analyze issues regarding same (4.3). [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding approvals; analyze indemnification and related issues regarding [REDACTED] (5.2).  | 9.50         |
| 01/10/17    | TPK             | Redraft briefs regarding objections to Special Administrator's brief   | 0.60         |
| 01/10/17    | TPK             | Redraft various briefs regarding objections.   | 2.50         |
| 01/10/17    | TPK             | Address and review strategy [REDACTED]   | 0.60         |
| 01/11/17    | AEK             | Communications and preparation of signatures; communications regarding declaration of R. Jackson; serve and electronically file same; conference with M. Pocock regarding re-filing of exhibits A-E of affidavit of S. Silton and affidavit of T. Nelson; serve and re-file same; communications, review and revise objection to accounting; prepare and research for exhibits to objection to accounting; serve and electronically file objection to accounting with the Court; prepare numerous documents for service and filing; conferences with M. Pocock regarding same; serve and electronically file numerous documents with court; conference with M. Pocock regarding hearing preparation; prepare documents for hearing on Jan. 12th. | 5.00         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 13

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Conference with T. Kane, J. Kolodny, and S. Silton regarding January 12 hearing and briefs to file.  | 0.70         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Compose emails to A. Kulbeik and M. Pocock regarding filings needed for memo in support of V. Jones as personal representative, objection to [REDACTED] and reply in support of memo to [REDACTED] | 0.60         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Compile [REDACTED] in preparation for January 12, 2017 hearing.  | 0.50         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Compose email to S. Silton attaching affidavits of O. Baker and T. Nelson for signature. Compose email to Nisha Anand attaching affidavit of V. Jones for signature.                               | 0.20         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Research and analysis of statutes and case law [REDACTED] Compile case law and email summary for T. Kane and J. Kolodny.   | 4.90         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Revise objection to L. McMillan, incorporating information regarding interactions with T. Nelson. Compose email to T. Kane regarding same.   | 3.50         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Review affidavit of R. Jackson in support of objection to [REDACTED]   | 0.30         |
| 01/11/17    | AFM             | Compose [REDACTED] Exchange correspondence with [REDACTED] regarding same.   | 0.30         |
| 01/11/17    | JBK             | Work on objections to Stinson accounting, legal analysis. Confs w/S. Silton, T. Kane, A. Mistry and M. Mallol re: same. Legal analysis re: same. Analysis. Working on preparation for litigation.  | 8.20         |
| 01/11/17    | MM              | Legal research, memo and correspondence re accounting issues   | 4.00         |
| 01/11/17    | SHS             | Review 1/12 hearing issues; draft direct and crosses; review and revise briefs   | 7.50         |
| 01/11/17    | TPK             | Prepare for 1/12 hearing with J. Kolodny and S. Silton regarding McMillan and Accounting issues.   | 5.50         |
| 01/12/17    | AEK             | Communications and preparation of documents for re-filing; conference with M. Pocock regarding same; serve and re-file documents with the Court; review filed pleadings.                           | 2.60         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 14

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/12/17    | JBK             | Prep for court. Attended court hearing and meetings with clients, T. Kane, S. Silton, V. Jones. Travel.  | 16.00        |
| 01/12/17    | MM              | Research and analysis regarding PR and accounting.   | 2.00         |
| 01/12/17    | SHS             | Prepare for hearing; travel to and attend hearing; meeting with clients  | 11.50        |
| 01/12/17    | TPK             | Traveled to and attended hearing on accounting of Stinson.   | 7.50         |
| 01/13/17    | AEK             | Communications with Court regarding post-hearing submissions; conference with T. Kane regarding same; communications regarding proposed order; conference with M. Pocock regarding same; review summons and complaint. | No Charge    |
| 01/13/17    | AFM             | Review Stinson's October and November 2016 invoices. Research case law [REDACTED] Draft objection to Stinson's legal fees through December 31, 2016.   | 7.80         |
| 01/13/17    | AFM             | Review and revise memo in support of request for fees and affidavits of T. Kane and S. Silton in support. Review redacted invoice.   | 2.40         |
| 01/13/17    | JBK             | Work on [REDACTED]   | 0.50         |
| 01/13/17    | MM              | Research and analysis regarding PR and accounting.   | 4.00         |
| 01/13/17    | SHS             | Review hearing issues; analyze issues regarding follow up briefs; analyze next steps; review issues regarding accounting; review issues regarding [REDACTED] analyze agency issues; office conference with team        | 9.00         |
| 01/13/17    | TPK             | Address issues raised by 1/12 hearing.   | 0.40         |
| 01/14/17    | AFM             | Conduct research regarding [REDACTED] Compile relevant statutes and case law.  | 5.70         |
| 01/14/17    | JBK             | Email correspondence w/S. Silton and counsel re: issues related to accounting, liability, objections, etc.   | 1.40         |
| 01/14/17    | MM              | Research re: PR and accounting; correspondence re: same.   | 2.50         |
| 01/15/17    | AFM             | Conduct research regarding [REDACTED] Compile relevant statutes and case law. Compose email to S. Silton, T. Kane, and J. Kolodny regarding findings.  | 4.90         |
| 01/15/17    | AFM             | Review and revise objection to Stinson's legal fees through December 31, 2016.   | 3.20         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 15

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>  | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|---|--------------|
| 01/15/17    | AFM             | Review and revise motion for Cozen's fees.  | 1.90         |
| 01/15/17    | JBK             | Correspondence related to legal strategy, next steps re: objections to Bremer's accounting.   | 0.40         |
| 01/16/17    | JBK             | Consideration of [REDACTED] Review of Memo of law re: same. Consideration of [REDACTED]   | 0.50         |
| 01/16/17    | MM              | Research regarding PR and accounting; correspondence re: same.  | 3.00         |
| 01/16/17    | SHS             | Telephone conference with Comerica; Telephone conference with V. Jones; analyze issues regarding same; review next steps  | 4.80         |
| 01/16/17    | TPK             | Draft brief re Stinson fees.  | 0.90         |
| 01/16/17    | TPK             | Draft memo regarding hearing.   | 2.10         |
| 01/17/17    | AEK             | Redact fees for fee petition; docket post-hearing submissions deadlines on firm docket; communications with the Court regarding hearing transcript; review and revise memo and objection to Stinson fees; redact memorandum; prepare proposed order; conference with A. Mistry regarding same; serve and electronically file objection, sealed memorandum, redacted memorandum and proposed order with the Court; review order regarding fee submissions. | 2.10         |
| 01/17/17    | AFM             | Review and revise objection to Stinson's fees and memorandum in support, incorporating edits from T. Kane and J. Kolodny. Prepare objection and memo in support for filing. Correspond with A. Kulbeik regarding filing.  | 4.40         |
| 01/17/17    | AFM             | Review research [REDACTED] Correspond with T. Kane and J. Kolodny regarding supplemental [REDACTED] Begin drafting supplemental objections, incorporating case law research.  | 3.80         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 16

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/17/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze: affidavit of A. Jackson; Pro Hac Vice motion of Chris Hoffman; O Baker reply in support [REDACTED] and related affidavit and exhibits; Gray Plant motion for clarification; O Baker motion for extension of time to file opposition to petition for order approving accounting; O Baker objection to petition for formal adjudication of intestacy and related affidavit and exhibits; memorandum in opposition to McMillan motion to compel and related affidavit; O Baker objections to final account through 11/30/16; Claire Elliot objection to petition for formal intestacy; O Baker petition for formal adjudication of heirs and related affidavits and exhibits; limited objection of [REDACTED] for order approving accounting; Bremer trust's response to objections filed by O Baker; Court orders from January 12, 2017; January 13, 2017, | 4.50         |
| 01/17/17    | JBK             | Work on objections to Stinson's fees including strategies and review of draft documents for submission to court. Telephone conf w/T. Kane and A. Mistry and M. Mallol re: issues related to objections to accounting. Review of documents on [REDACTED] Draft email concerning objections to accounting related to [REDACTED]  | 5.20         |
| 01/17/17    | MM              | Research and analysis re: [REDACTED]   | 9.00         |
| 01/17/17    | SHS             | Office conference with T. Kane and A. Mistry regarding [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding [REDACTED] review issues regarding same; analyze [REDACTED] analyze next steps  | 6.80         |
| 01/17/17    | TPK             | Review [REDACTED] from Special administrator.  | 1.00         |
| 01/17/17    | TPK             | Draft attorney fees objection.   | 0.50         |
| 01/17/17    | TPK             | Draft Attorney's fees objection.   | 0.90         |
| 01/18/17    | AEK             | Review docketing emails; review filed pleadings; review emails regarding orders in word format; communications with the court regarding proposed orders in Word format; conference with M. Pocock regarding same; exchange emails regarding [REDACTED] review email from court regarding redacted memo and re-filing; re-file redacted memorandum regarding Stinson fees with the Court;   | 2.30         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 17

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/18/17    | AFM             | Draft supplemental objection to Bremer's accounting and discharge, incorporating information from January 12 hearing, previous objections, review of accounting, and case law researched. Draft affidavit of S. Silton in support of objection. Compile exhibits to attach to objection.   | 7.40         |
| 01/18/17    | AFM             | Correspond with J. Kolodny, T. Kane, and S. Silton regarding supplemental objection. Correspond with M. Pocock, A. Kulbeik, and T. Markward regarding [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] cited in objection and compose email regarding same.   | 1.60         |
| 01/18/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze: O Baker objection to special administrator's request for legal fees through 12/31/16; court orders dated 1/18/17   | 0.70         |
| 01/18/17    | JBK             | Working on issues related to submission of court documents for post hearing objections to accounting. Telephone confs w/T. Kane and A. Mistry re: same. Review of court correspondence and filings.  | 1.90         |
| 01/18/17    | MM              | Research and analysis re: [REDACTED] correspondence  | 2.80         |
| 01/18/17    | SHS             | Review issues regarding [REDACTED] review issues regarding same; telephone conference with C. Koppelman  | 6.50         |
| 01/18/17    | TPK             | Draft objections to Bremer's discharge.  | 1.50         |
| 01/19/17    | AEK             | Revise proposed order for sealing exhibits to S. Silton affidavit and supplemental memorandum; communications with Court regarding protocol for service under seal; prepare memorandum and affidavit of S. Silton for filing; redact memorandum for filing; conferences with A. Mistry and T. Kane regarding same; re-file original documents. | 2.20         |
| 01/19/17    | AFM             | Review order regarding personal representative to the estate. Correspond with S. Silton regarding same.  | 0.50         |
| 01/19/17    | AFM             | Review and revise [REDACTED] Incorporate edits from S. Silton. Correspond with A. Kulbeik and T. Kane regarding [REDACTED]   | 4.10         |
| 01/19/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze O Baker supplement objections to final account through 11/30/16, final account from 12/1/16 through 12/31/16 and petition for order approving accounting, related affidavits and exhibits; Attorney fee affidavit or L Hafferty and related exhibit; affidavit of C Ordal and related exhibit;                              | 1.30         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 18

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/19/17    | JBK             | Work on objections. Review court documents. Consideration of and review of documents submitted to court by Bremer and Stinson to support claim for approval of fees. Consideration of court order.   | 2.20         |
| 01/19/17    | SHS             | Travel to NYC; meet with C. Koppelman regarding [REDACTED] (3.5) Meet with [REDACTED] (3.0) Telephone conference with client; review issues regarding hearing; analyze issues regarding same (2.1).  | 8.60         |
| 01/19/17    | TPK             | Draft brief regarding objection to accounting.   | 1.00         |
| 01/20/17    | AEK             | Revise proposed order to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review summons and complaint; docket answer deadline on firm docket; review communications regarding [REDACTED]; review file materials regarding same; prepare e-mail regarding [REDACTED]  | 2.10         |
| 01/20/17    | AFM             | Review October 28 order regarding time to object to request for fees. Compose email to J. Kolodny regarding same.  | 0.50         |
| 01/20/17    | AFM             | Draft objection to Special Administrator's fees and its legal fees, incorporating comments from T. Kane and J. Kolodny.  | 5.20         |
| 01/20/17    | JBK             | Working on objections to request for payment of legal fees for Stinson. Telephone conf w/T. Kane and A. Mistry re: same. Telephone conf w/S. Silton re: next steps, [REDACTED] administration matters.   | 1.10         |
| 01/20/17    | SHS             | Review issues with [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding [REDACTED] review open issues; analyze [REDACTED] issues.   | 6.90         |
| 01/20/17    | TPK             | Call J. Kolodny regarding accounting issues raised by Cozen objection.   | 0.50         |
| 01/20/17    | TPK             | Call L. Kramer at Stinson regarding sealing documents of S.A.  | 0.50         |
| 01/23/17    | AEK             | Communications regarding [REDACTED] review file materials regarding same; conferences regarding order on sealed documents; review order; redact supplemental memorandum with regard to fees; re-file redacted supplemental memorandum with the Court; communications with the court and S. Silton regarding hearing transcript; conference regarding sealed order. | 2.60         |
| 01/23/17    | AFM             | Review order from the Court regarding filing under seal. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.   | 0.70         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 19

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>  | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|---|--------------|
| 01/23/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze court order dated 1/23/17; review SA's Request for the Court [REDACTED]  | 0.70         |
| 01/23/17    | JBK             | Preparation for telephone conf. w/Greiner re: [REDACTED]  | 0.40         |
| 01/23/17    | SHS             | Continue review of discharge and related issues; continue revision of memorandum regarding the same; analyze issues regarding same; review issues regarding transition  | 7.90         |
| 01/23/17    | TPK             | Call Judge Eide regarding L. Kramer's objection to [REDACTED] references  | 0.60         |
| 01/24/17    | AEK             | Review filed pleadings; review court docket regarding status of filed documents.  | 0.70         |
| 01/24/17    | EGR             | Review and analyze court order dated 1/24/17; review Petitioner's request in response to SA petition to de-designate documents  | 0.30         |
| 01/24/17    | SHS             | Meeting with M. Greiner regarding transition; review issues regarding same; analyze next steps; review objection; review legal issues regarding transition without discharge; analyze issues regarding same; review factual issues                        | 8.50         |
| 01/24/17    | TPK             | Emails and address strategy regarding one year time period  | 0.30         |
| 01/25/17    | AEK             | Exchange communications regarding document from conference call Monday; exchange emails regarding same; prepare e-mail to Court regarding document and title from conference call; exchange emails regarding re-filing; re-file documents with the Court; | 2.10         |
| 01/25/17    | JBK             | Review of court documents.  | 0.20         |
| 01/25/17    | MM              | Review correspondence re: filings and PR.   | 0.50         |
| 01/25/17    | SHS             | Review [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same; review next steps on [REDACTED] review and revise brief regarding discharge; analyze legal objections  | 7.40         |
| 01/25/17    | TPK             | Address filing issues with court administrator.   | 0.40         |
| 01/26/17    | AEK             | Review and docket deadlines for firm docket; review filings; review of upcoming deadlines.  | 1.00         |
| 01/26/17    | EGR             | Review Lommen Abdo motion to seal unredacted supporting papers and related proposed order; review court order dated 1/26/17; review [REDACTED] request  | 0.30         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 20

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>  | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|---|--------------|
| 01/26/17    | MM              | Review correspondence re: filings and PR.   | 0.50         |
| 01/26/17    | SHS             | Review transition issues; telephone conference with Comerica; review issues regarding same; review [REDACTED] review outstanding issues regarding same; prepare for phone conference with the Judge   | 6.30         |
| 01/27/17    | AEK             | Communications regarding reply brief to response regarding fees; review order; exchange communications regarding deadlines; docket case deadlines.  | 2.10         |
| 01/27/17    | AFM             | Draft reply in support of objection to Bremer's accounting and discharge. Review and revise motion, memo, and proposed order to seal reply. Correspond with T. Kane, S. Siltan, and J. Kolodny regarding same.  | 6.90         |
| 01/27/17    | EGR             | Review SA motion to allow unredacted reply memorandum to be filed under seal, related affidavit and proposed order; review SA reply to objections by O Baker to SA petition for discharge and related affidavit, exhibits; review court order 1/27/17 | 1.70         |
| 01/27/17    | JBK             | Review of response to objections to accounting from Stinson. Telephone conf w/T. Kane and A. Mistry re: same. Email correspondence re: same. Consideration of arguments and responses.  | 3.20         |
| 01/27/17    | MM              | Correspondence, research re: accounting   | 6.00         |
| 01/27/17    | SHS             | Review transition issues; telephone conference with client; [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same; review B. Nelson issues; telephone conference with court; analyze next steps  | 7.40         |
| 01/27/17    | TPK             | Call to court re issues Friday call   | 0.60         |
| 01/27/17    | TPK             | Call to Kolodny regarding objections to final accounting.   | 0.40         |
| 01/27/17    | TPK             | Address strategy with S. Siltan and J. Kolodny.   | 0.60         |
| 01/27/17    | TPK             | Draft brief in reply to Stinson brief on objections to accounting.  | 0.50         |
| 01/27/17    | TPK             | Analyze [REDACTED] and prepare response   | 0.40         |
| 01/28/17    | SHS             | Telephone conference with C. Koppleman; analyze issues regarding ongoing entertainment experts; review issues regarding same; telephone conference with M. Lythcott regarding support [REDACTED]  | 5.40         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 21

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b> |
|-------------|-----------------|--|--------------|
| 01/29/17    | AFM             | Draft objection to Bremer's fee affidavit, Stinson's fee affidavit, and Stinson's December 2016 invoice. Correspond with T. Kane, S. Siltan, and J. Kolodny regarding same.  | 4.50         |
| 01/29/17    | AFM             | Review and revise reply in support of objection to Bremer's accounting and discharge, incorporating edits from J. Kolodny, T. Kane, and S. Siltan. Compose email to M. Pocock regarding filings needed.                            | 3.80         |
| 01/29/17    | JBK             | Review of reply re: objections. Tconfs w/A. Mistry re: comments on reply.  | 2.10         |
| 01/29/17    | MM              | Research re: [REDACTED]  | 4.50         |
| 01/29/17    | SHS             | Review status of transition; telephone conference with F. Wheaton; analyze issues regarding ongoing relationships between the heirs; review [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same; telephone conference with V. Jones           | 4.80         |
| 01/29/17    | TPK             | Redraft objection to fees by Stinson   | 0.90         |
| 01/29/17    | TPK             | Redraft Objection to accounting  | 0.90         |
| 01/30/17    | AEK             | Communications and assisting with service and filing of reply to response regarding fees; communications regarding service and filing of objection; review court docket and filings; review order issued for documents under seal. | 1.40         |
| 01/30/17    | AFM             | Review and revise objection to Bremer's fee affidavit, Stinson's fee affidavit, and Stinson's December 2016 invoice, incorporating edits from T. Kane.   | 1.50         |
| 01/30/17    | AFM             | Call with T. Kane to counsel for Sharon, Norrine, and John Nelson; Alfred Jackson, and Comerica regarding Brianna Nelson complaint.  | 0.30         |
| 01/30/17    | EGR             | Review O Baker Reply in support of objections to final account and related affidavits; review O Baker objection to SA's request for fees and related exhibit   | 1.00         |
| 01/30/17    | JBK             | Work on reply to Stinson re: objections to accounting and legal fees. Review of [REDACTED] Telephone conf. w/T. Kane.  | 2.00         |
| 01/30/17    | MM              | Correspondence re: accounting.   | 0.80         |
| 01/30/17    | SHS             | Meet with M. Greiner to discuss open issues; review [REDACTED] analyze same; review issues regarding protocol; emails to opposing party; telephone conference with C. Koppelman regarding same; multiple calls with B. Labate      | 7.80         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:March 03, 2017  
Page 22

| <b>Date</b>                | <b>Initials</b> | <b>Description of Services</b>   | <b>Hours</b>  |
|----------------------------|-----------------|--|---------------|
| 01/30/17                   | TPK             | Draft objection to Stinson fees.   | 0.60          |
| 01/30/17                   | TPK             | Outline issues to address with heirs counsel to respond to Brianna complaint.  | 0.80          |
| 01/30/17                   | TPK             | Address issue regarding commence of one year period to determine heirs.  | 0.90          |
| 01/30/17                   | TPK             | Address issue regarding [REDACTED]   | 0.40          |
| 01/31/17                   | AEK             | Assist with letter and exhibits to Judge Eide; prepare e-mail to court regarding same; communications regarding filings; review and update service list.   | 2.30          |
| 01/31/17                   | AFM             | Correspond with S. Silton [REDACTED] Review and revise letter to Judge Eide regarding [REDACTED] Correspond with A. Kulbeik and M. Pocock regarding same. Draft notice of motion and motion, memo, and proposed order to file letter under seal. | 2.30          |
| 01/31/17                   | EGR             | Review [REDACTED] review amended certificate of representation; review correspondence from Holland & Knight regarding [REDACTED] review O Baker mtn to allow letter to court; review Court order dated 1/31/17                                   | 1.80          |
| 01/31/17                   | JBK             | Review of court documents.   | 0.40          |
| 01/31/17                   | MM              | Call with T. Kane. research re [REDACTED]  | 2.00          |
| 01/31/17                   | SHS             | Review [REDACTED] analyze issues regarding same; review and revise letter to the court; court hearing;   | 8.50          |
| 01/31/17                   | TPK             | Address strategy regarding [REDACTED]  | 0.80          |
| 01/31/17                   | TPK             | Call M. Mallol regarding the [REDACTED]  | 0.40          |
| <b>Total Hours Billed:</b> |                 |  | <b>800.90</b> |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 23

**Time And Fee Summary**

| <b>Timekeeper</b> | <b>Rate</b> | <b>Hours</b>     | <b>Fees</b>       |
|-------------------|-------------|------------------|-------------------|
| Silton, S.        |             | \$               |                   |
| Silton, S.        |             |                  |                   |
| Kane, T.          |             |                  |                   |
| Kane, T.          |             |                  |                   |
| Kolodny, J.       |             |                  |                   |
| Kolodny, J.       |             |                  |                   |
| Mallol, M.        |             |                  |                   |
| Mistry, A.        |             |                  |                   |
| Mistry, A.        |             |                  |                   |
| Rapoport, E.      |             |                  |                   |
| Rapoport, E.      |             |                  |                   |
| Kulbeik, A.       |             |                  |                   |
| Kulbeik, A.       |             |                  |                   |
| <b>Totals:</b>    |             | <b>800.90 \$</b> | <b>354,258.00</b> |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 24

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Disbursements</b>   | <b>Value</b> |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| 12/05/16    | Travel & Meals Subject to I.R.S. Limitations on Business Meals and Travel Expenses Lunch 12/05/16, Steven Silton Business Development: Lunch provided for attorney meeting 12/5/16 (no receipt), the Brothers Deli 05 Minneapolis MN, the Brothers Deli 05 Minneapolis MN  | \$ 65.81     |
| 12/12/16    | Travel Related Expenses Misc Airline Fee 12/12/16, Steven Silton Business Development: Inflight wi-fi charge to access client and attorneys during 8 hour flight., Airline wi-fi, Gogoinflight Wifi 877-350-0038 IL  | 34.74        |
| 12/13/16    | Duplicating 12 copies 12/13  | 3.00         |
| 12/17/16    | Travel Related Expenses Misc Airline Fee 12/17/16, Steven Silton Baker: Internet Access for case while in flight 12/17/17 (no receipt provided), Wi-Fi in Flight, Gogoinflight Wifi 877-350-0038 IL  | 21.95        |
| 12/23/16    | Travel Related Expenses  | 40.00        |
| 12/27/16    | Travel Related Expenses Misc Airline Fee 12/27/16, Steven Silton Baker: Internet Access for case while in flight 12/27/17 (no receipt provided), Wi-Fi In Flight, Gogoinflight Wifi 877-350-0038 IL  | 22.93        |
| 12/31/16    | Travel Related Expenses Airfare 12/31/16, Jeffrey Kolodny Travel to with extra leg room), New York - Minneapolis, Minnesota, Economy, Round Trip, 0067914135901, Minneapolis for client meeting (this was a rebook on 1/2/17 - 1/4/17 tickets to get seats 01/10/2017 to 01/12/2017, Delta Air Lines Inc. Douglassville PA | 1,006.20     |
| 12/31/16    | Travel Related Expenses  | 40.00        |
| 01/03/17    | Travel & Meals Subject to I.R.S. Limitations on Business Meals and Travel Expenses Lunch 01/03/17, Steven Silton Baker Meeting: Lunch for in-office attorney meeting with Heir counsels, Bitesquad Minneapolis MN, Bitesquad Minneapolis MN  | 53.32        |
| 01/03/17    | Travel & Meals Subject to I.R.S. Limitations on Business Meals and Travel Expenses Lunch 01/03/17, Steven Silton Baker Meeting: Lunch for in-office attorney meeting with Heir counsels, Bitesquad Minneapolis MN, Bitesquad Minneapolis MN  | 17.76        |
| 01/03/17    | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/03/2017 MALLOL, MICHELLE   | 750.00       |
| 01/05/17    | Filing Fees Filing Fees and Related 01/05/17, Thomas Wallrich Filing Fee for Motion for Extension of Time to File Opposition, Carver County District Court, Filing Fee   | 107.00       |
| 01/05/17    | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/05/2017 MISTRY, ARMEEN   | 79.00        |
| 01/08/17    | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/08/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Taxi to office, NYC Taxi - Verifone Long Isalnd City NY, NYC - NYC, One Way, NYC Taxi - Verifone Long Isalnd City NY  | 13.00        |
| 01/08/17    | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/08/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Taxi to office, Via, NYC - NYC, One Way   | 6.48         |
| 01/10/17    | Travel Related Expenses Public Transit 01/10/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Train from airport to hotel in Minnesota, Train, Minnesota - Minnesota, One Way   | 1.75         |
| 01/10/17    | Travel Related Expenses Lodging 01/10/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Hotel  | 219.00       |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 25

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Disbursements</b>   | <b>Value</b> |
|-------------|--|--------------|
|             | for meeting regarding Estate of Prince Nelson, Westin Minneapolis W Minneapolis MN, 2 nights, 01/10/2017 to 01/12/2017   |              |
| 01/10/17    | Miscellaneous Other 01/10/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Taxes for hotel for meeting regarding Estate of Prince Nelson, Westin Minneapolis W Minneapolis MN   | 29.35        |
| 01/10/17    | Filing Fees Filing Fees and Related 01/10/17, Thomas Wallrich Filing Fee for Motion for Extension of Time to File Opposition., Carver County District Court, Filing Fee  | 107.00       |
| 01/10/17    | Filing Fees Filing Fees and Related 01/10/17, Thomas Wallrich Filing Fee for Motion to Compel, Carver County District Court, Filing Fee  | 107.00       |
| 01/11/17    | Travel Related Expenses Lodging 01/11/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Hotel for meeting regarding Estate of Prince Nelson, Westin Minneapolis W Minneapolis MN, 2 nights, 01/10/2017 to 01/12/2017   | 219.00       |
| 01/11/17    | Miscellaneous Other 01/11/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Taxes for hotel for meeting regarding Estate of Prince Nelson, Westin Minneapolis W Minneapolis MN   | 29.35        |
| 01/11/17    | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/11/2017 MALLOL, MICHELLE   | 750.00       |
| 01/12/17    | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/12/17, Jeffrey Kolodny Taxi from airport to home, NYC Taxi, NYC - NYC, One Way   | 44.00        |
| 01/12/17    | Carver County Judicial Center Invoice 5678: Transcript of Hearing held on January 12, 2017   | 955.00       |
| 01/15/17    | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/15/2017 MISTRY, ARMEEN   | 316.00       |
| 01/15/17    | Westlaw Research Westlaw Research 01/15/2017 MISTRY,ARMEEN   | 79.00        |
| 01/17/17    | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/17/2017 MALLOL, MICHELLE   | 750.00       |
| 01/19/17    | Travel Related Expenses Lodging 01/19/17, Steven Silton Omarr Baker: Travel to New York for Meeting with Roc Nation (hotel charge), Hoteltonight*Eventi San Francisco CA, 1 night, 01/19/2017 to 01/20/2017  | 339.00       |
| 01/19/17    | Travel & Meals Subject to I.R.S. Limitations on Business Meals and Travel Expenses Lunch 01/19/17, Steven Silton Travel to New York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman (Travel Lunch), L'Amico / the Vine New York NY, L'Amico / the Vine New York NY           | 33.22        |
| 01/19/17    | Travel Related Expenses Airfare 01/19/17, Steven Silton Travel to New York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman (Flight Change fee), Lga - Msp, Economy, One Way, 0062368069956, 01/20/2017 to 01/20/2017, Delta Air Lines Atlanta Us                             | 54.00        |
| 01/19/17    | Travel & Meals Subject to I.R.S. Limitations on Business Meals and Travel Expenses Dinner 01/19/17, Steven Silton Travel to New York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman, O Ya Covina Roof At New York NY, O Ya Covina Roof At New York NY, C Koppelman, D Perez | 540.74       |
| 01/19/17    | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/19/17, Steven Silton Travel to New   | 6.49         |

Baker, Omarr  
File Number: 390086.000  
Invoice No.:

March 03, 2017  
Page 26

| Date     | Disbursements   | Value                |
|----------|---|----------------------|
|          | York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman (Taxi), Verifone Transportat Long Island City NY, Hotel - Meetings, One Way, Verifone Transportat Long Island City NY  |                      |
| 01/19/17 | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/19/17, Steven Silton Travel to New York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman (Taxi), 0000Nyctaxi3N31 0900 Brooklyn NY, Meetings - Hotel, One Way, 0000Nyctaxi3N31 0900 Brooklyn NY             | 27.00                |
| 01/20/17 | Travel Related Expenses Taxi 01/20/17, Steven Silton Travel to New York for meetings with Roc Nation, Charles Koppelman (Taxi Charge, Uber *Us Jan20 Mqz Help.Uber.Com CA, Hotel - Meetings, One Way, Uber *Us Jan20 Mqz Help.Uber.Com CA | 69.96                |
| 01/20/17 | Travel Related Expenses Parking 01/20/17, Steven Silton Airport Parking for travel to New York, Msp Airport Parking Saint Paul MN, Msp Airport Parking Saint Paul MN  | 144.00               |
| 01/27/17 | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/27/2017 MISTRY, ARMEEN  | 50.00                |
| 01/29/17 | Lexis Research Lexis Library 01/29/2017 MALLOL, MICHELLE  | 750.00               |
| 01/30/17 | Travel Related Expenses 12/16 Parking Validations Central Parking Invoice No. 1100003770  | 79.00                |
| 01/30/17 | Filing Fees Filing Fees and Related 01/30/17, Thomas Wallrich Our Reply in Support of Objections to Final Account., Carver County District Court, Filing Fee  | 107.00               |
| 01/31/17 | Pacer Fees - 01/09/17, Inv.# 2798093-Q42016   | 6.00                 |
| 01/31/17 | Long Distance Telephone 1 call 01/31  | 2.56                 |
| 01/31/17 | Filing Fees Filing Fees and Related 01/31/17, Thomas Wallrich Filing fee for Correspondence to Judge filed under seal., Carver County District Court, Filing Fee  | 107.00               |
| 02/16/17 | Court Reporter Jackie Knutson, 390086 02/15/17, 02/15/2017, Original Transcript and one copy of hearing held on January 31, 2017, 02/15/2017, 250241, Steven H Silton   | 264.00               |
|          | <b>Total Disbursements:</b>   | <b>\$ 8,447.61</b>   |
|          | <b>Total Current Charges:</b>   | <b>\$ 362,705.61</b> |

# EXHIBIT B



1161 W. Fairway Road  
Pembroke Pines, FL 33026  
Phone 954-608-7755

**DATE:** 03/02/17  
**INVOICE #** EEI-17-076

**Bill To:**

Cozen O'Connor  
33 South 6th Street, Suite 4640  
Minneapolis, MN 55402

| DESCRIPTION  |       | AMOUNT            |
|--|-------|-------------------|
| In re the Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson, deceased |       | Hours @ \$400     |
| Expert witness opinion/affidavit                   | 18.50 | \$ 7,400.00       |
|  |       | \$ -              |
|  |       | \$ -              |
|  |       | \$ -              |
| <b>TOTAL</b>                                       |       | 18.50 \$ 7,400.00 |

Make all checks payable to **Elton Entertainment, Inc.**

If you have any questions concerning this invoice, contact  
Serona Elton, 954-608-7755, [serona@eltonentertainment.com](mailto:serona@eltonentertainment.com)