

STATE OF MINNESOTA
COUNTY OF CARVER

DISTRICT COURT
FIRST JUDICIAL DISTRICT
PROBATE DIVISION

In Re:

Court File No.: 10-PR-16-46

Judge: Kevin W. Eide

Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson,

Decedent.

**AFFIDAVIT OF JUSTIN A. BRUNTJEN
IN RESPONSE TO SPECIAL MASTER
JUDGE RICHARD SOLUM'S ORDER
REGARDING PROCEDURE FOR FEE
APPLICATIONS**

STATE OF MINNESOTA)
) ss.
COUNTY OF HENNEPIN)

I, Justin A. Bruntjen, after being duly sworn, state as follows:

1. I am an attorney duly licensed to practice and in good standing in the State of Minnesota. If called as a witness, I could and would competently testify to the facts stated here based on my own personal knowledge.

2. Until November 2, 2018 I was attorney of record for Alfred Jackson ("Jackson") for a period of more than two and half years. I submit this affidavit in response to Special Master Judge Richard Solum's Order Regarding Procedure for Fee Applications.

3. Jackson retained me in April of 2016 to provide legal services regarding the Estate of his late brother, Prince Rogers Nelson (the "Estate"). I formally filed a notice of appearance in this matter on April 26, 2016 and withdrew as Jackson's counsel of record over two and a half years later, on November 2, 2018.

4. Attached and Incorporated into this Affidavit as Exhibit A is my original invoice for services related to Heirship of the Estate. I have gone through this invoice and added entries that pertain to Heirship but were originally submitted in a different fee bucket. I also subtracted any fee entries that were incorrectly placed in the original Heirship bucket of my fee application for February 2017 through December 2017. The new total requested for all Heirship related work is \$53,253.00.

5. Attached and Incorporated into this Affidavit as Exhibit B is my invoice for services related to UMG Rescission for February 2017 through November 2018. The total for work related to the UMG Agreement is \$52,089.00

6. Attached and Incorporated into this Affidavit as Exhibit C is my original invoice for services related to the Removal of Comerica as Personal Representative. I have gone through this invoice and added entries that pertain to the Removal of Comerica but were originally submitted in a different fee bucket. I also subtracted any fee entries that were incorrectly placed in the original Removal of Comerica bucket of my fee application for February 2017 through December 2017. The new total for all related work related to the removal of Comerica is \$17,072.00.

7. Attached and Incorporated into this Affidavit as Exhibit D are my original invoices from February 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017 and January 1, 2018 through November 2, 2018, for services related to Jobu, McMillan and Koppelman issues. I have gone through these invoices and added entries that pertain to Jobu, Koppelman and McMillan but were originally submitted in a different fee bucket. I also subtracted any fee entries that were incorrectly placed in the original Jobu, McMillan and Koppelman bucket of my fee applications. The new total for all Jobu, McMillan and Koppelman related work is \$63,186.00.

8. Attached and Incorporated into this Affidavit as Exhibit E are my original invoices

from February 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017 and January 1, 2018 through November 2, 2018, for services related to engagement and work of the Second Special Administrator. I have gone through these invoices and added entries that pertain to engagement and work of the Second Special Administrator but were originally submitted in a different fee bucket. I also subtracted any fee entries that were incorrectly placed in the original Second Special Administrator bucket of my fee applications. The new total for all work related to the Second Special Administrator is \$47,854.00.

9. In addition to the above categories of work incurred for the benefit of the Estate, there are buckets that the court previously held were eligible for reimbursement from the Estate as work that benefitted the Estate as a whole. Since Attorney fees were previously awarded for these categories I ask that the Special Master follow the courts original decision in this regard and order the Estate to pay fees for these specific buckets. The previously awarded fee categories are:

- a. Work related to Entertainment matters- this includes but is not limited to the Netflix, Unipix, Symphonic, Apple and other entertainment transactions and work related to Prince's music and brand.
- b. Work related to Paisley Park
- c. Work related to the Tribute Concert
- d. Work related to appointing a Personal Representative- which includes transitioning from the Special Administrator to the current Personal Representative, Comerica Trust.
- e. Court Appearances and Phone Calls

10. Further, there are other areas of work that I performed that were beneficial to the Estate as a whole and Affiant asks that the Special Master award Attorney fees for work related to these issues.

11. Affiant believes that fees for all work related to the Accounting and Discharge of the Special Administrator, Bremer Trust, should be awarded as work incurred for the benefit of the Estate as a whole. The current Personal Representative, Comerica Trust, signed a Common Interest agreement with Bremer upon their appointment in February 2017. This agreement forced Affiant and other heir's attorneys to be the only line of defense in providing oversight on Bremer's actions as Special Administrator. Although the Court ruled against the Heir's opposition of Bremer's discharge I withdrew from representing Jackson prior to the issue fully being resolved. In fact, the Attorneys that replaced me in representing Jackson filed a notice of appeal to Bremer's discharge, which the status of is currently unknown to Affiant. If not for the checks on the previous Special Administrator by Affiant, they would have been able to bill the Estate infinite amounts of money with no one in place to challenge them. Affiant's active role in monitoring and objecting to the Special Administrator saved the Estate unquantifiable amounts of money that the Special Administrator and their Attorneys could have requested without challenge.

12. Affiant is also entitled to fees for all work related Real Estate transactions involving the Estate. As with Entertainment and Paisley Park these are assets that will one day be controlled by the Heirs. It was important for the Heirs to have input into how these assets were dealt with. This work includes but is not limited to the sale of the Galpin property and the auction of the Turks and Caicos residence. Regarding Galpin, Affiant and other heir's counsel participated and were instrumental in working to improve this agreement and the results ended in better material terms for the transaction. In regards to the Turks and Caicos property I believe that the original idea to hold on Auction came from one of the heirs. This shows how important and instrumental having the heirs up to date and able to provide input was when handling Estate assets.

13. Affiant is entitled to fees for all work incurred in regards to the discharge and approval of interim accounting requested by Comerica. Affiant's work relating to the discharge and

approval of Comerica's interim accounting resulted in Comerica changing the language of their proposed order and resulted in the Estate having more legal recourse against them if they are found to have done anything wrong. Also in regard to Comerica's fees Affiant was one of the only people able to provide oversight to make sure that these fees were just and reasonable. If not for Affiant's work, Comerica and their counsel could have billed the Estate for a much greater amount than they did and there would have been no one to oppose their bills.

14. Work performed by Affiant related to the appointment of Gregg Walker and Charles Spicer as Heirs' Representatives should also be considered beneficial to the Estate as a whole and fees incurred by Affiant in this regard should be paid by the Estate. Judge Eide saw the importance of giving the Heirs a voice in decisions and negotiations involving the Estate when he appointed Gregg Walker and Charles Spicer as heirs' representatives. After appointment, Mr. Walker and Mr. Spicer worked with the Personal Representative, their advisors and attorneys to improve multiple entertainment deals, which benefitted the Estate and facilitated a better relationship between Comerica and the heirs. Without the appointment of the heirs' representatives the Heirs would have been left in the dark on many issues and likely created more legal expenses for the Estate trying to improve transparency by Comerica.

15. All work related to keeping the heirs informed and up to date on the workings of the Estate should also be paid be considered a benefit to the Estate as a whole and Affiant should be paid for any all fees incurred for this work. This includes, reviewing new documents, appointing an heirs representative, requesting financials, emails and all requests made for transparency of information between Comerica and the Heirs. Once this Estate is closed, the Heirs stand to inherit the job of running it and keeping them informed on the day-to-day activities and making sure Comerica is as transparent as possible will help the heirs in the future in efficiently and effectively running the Estate. In the long-run this knowledge and experience the heirs have gained by staying

informed and up-to-date will save the Estate considerable amounts of money and make for an easier and cheaper transition overall.

In fact the Court has stated multiple times that facilitating communication between the Heirs and the Personal Representative and keeping the Heirs up to date on Estate affairs is in the best interests of the Estate. In Its December 18, 2017 order Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law & Order Denying Petition to Permanently Remove Comerica Bank and Trust N.A. as Personal Representative (Attached as Exhibit F) the Court states: “the Court believes it to be far more in the best interest of the Estate to attempt to improve the level or manner of communication between Comerica and the heirs, their attorneys and their advisors so that all heirs feel they are properly advised regarding the administration of the Estate and their input is considered.” (*Id At pg. 12,13*). Further in the Court’s April 23, 2019 Order Regarding Personal Representative’s Fees and Costs For February 2019 Through January 2020 & Petition to Limit Authority of Personal Representative (Attached as Exhibit G) the Court states, “The Court has required a significant level of communication between the Personal Representative and The Heirs.” (*Id. At pg. 3*). This language used by the Court clearly shows that all work done to improve communication and transparency between the Heirs and the Personal Representative is beneficial to the Estate as a whole and Affiant believes that The Estate should pay all fees related to this as work performed for the overall benefit of The Estate.

16. For the above reason Affiant believes that the work performed per his submitted invoices were for the benefit of the Estate as a whole and requests that a ruling be made ordering the Estate to pay the fees submitted in his February 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017 and January 1, 2018 through November 2, 2018 requests.

Exhibit A

Heirship

INVOICE

Number	3
Issue Date	2/5/2019
Due Date	3/7/2019

Bill To:

Alfred Jackson

Time Entries

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Sub
Review/analyze 2/3/2017 review appeal memo and research issues regarding Brianna appeal, review and reply to communications regarding the same.	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.20	\$1,552.00
Communicate (other external) 2/3/2017 review and respond to emails regarding service of BN appeal and other related issues	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.60	\$776.00
Review/analyze 2/6/2017 review Elliot heirship paperwork	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Communicate (other external) 2/6/2017 review and respond to emails regarding BN appeal, follow up research on issues discussed.	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.80	\$1,358.00
Communicate (other external) 2/9/2017 review and respond to emails regarding continuance motion	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Communicate (other external) 2/9/2017 call with FW about appeal issues for BN	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Research 2/10/2017 potential issues regarding transition and other heirship issues and review documents related to Cousins claim	jabruntjen	\$485.00	4.20	\$2,037.00
Review/analyze 2/13/2017 review Kane's appeal filing and declaration	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Review/analyze 2/14/2017 call with heirs attorneys, Cassioppi and BN attorney	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Communicate (other external) 2/14/2017 emails from Parkhurst and Cassioppi regarding order for DNA testing and other issues.	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 2/14/2017 call with FW about fees, Parkhurst appeal, DNA testing, and other heirship issues	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.50	\$1,212.50

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Review/analyze 2/15/2017 Review Venita Jackson filings and follow up	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Review/analyze 2/16/2017 review Bremer filings and court orders regarding sealing DNA results and other findings	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Review/analyze 2/20/2017 review and comment to Cassioppi motion to dismiss BN claims and research issues	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	3.10	\$1,503.50
Review/analyze 2/23/2017 review Parkhurst declaration and motion opposing extension. Follow call regarding the same	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.30	\$630.50
Review/analyze 2/24/2017 review appellate court order.	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	0.30	\$145.50
Appear for/attend 2/28/2017 prepare for and participate in call with heirs attorneys regarding appeals, DNA, and other heirship issues	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.80	\$873.00
Communicate (other external) 2/28/2017 call with FW following phone call with heirs attorneys. Discussion of topics including appeal issues.	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Review/analyze 3/2/2017 review Fredlaw appeal memorandum in response to court February 23 order and follow ups research on issues raised.	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	3.20	\$1,552.00
Communicate (other external) 3/2/2017 review and respond to emails from BN attorneys and other heirs attorneys	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 3/4/2017 call with FW about attorney fee submissions and other heirship issues	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 3/6/2017 review changes made to PR appeal motion as well as emails regarding the same	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	1.10	\$533.50
Review/analyze 3/6/2017 review Parkhurst and Venita Jackson appeal memo regarding jurisdiction question and follow up communication regarding the same	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	2.20	\$1,067.00
Review/analyze 3/7/2017 review documents relating to BN appeal including motion requiring dept. of health, order regarding parentage documents, Baker order about accounting and other documents. Follow up research into BN motion	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	3.20	\$1,552.00
Communicate (other external) 3/7/2017 Call with FW regarding Gresham and Leverette appeals	jabrunstjen	\$485.00	0.70	\$339.50

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Review/analyze 3/16/2017 review and research issues related to Venita Jackson objections and memo, review objections to Stinson fees and other related documents, and PRs response to objection regarding protocols	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.60	\$1,261.00
Communicate (other external) 3/23/2017 review and respond to emails regarding heirship.	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.70	\$339.50
Research 3/24/2017 research issues regarding determination of heirs and follow up conversation with other heirs counsel about the same	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.80	\$1,843.00
Draft/revise 3/28/2017 review and revised Gresham and Leverette Appeal brief	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Communicate (other external) 3/29/2017 review and respond to emails regarding the Leverette and Gresham appeal brief	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 3/30/2017 review and respond to emails regarding loans Prince made to other parties during his lifetime	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.20	\$97.00
Review/analyze 4/2/2017 look into issues regarding motion to determine heirs and discussing with other heirs counsel about the. same	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.60	\$776.00
Communicate (other external) 4/3/2017 email correspondence back and forth with Comerica regarding a media inquiry and statements to be made	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Review/analyze 4/5/2017 review court of appeal fillings concerning Jackson-Leverette and research issues regarding the same	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Draft/revise 4/8/2017 review and look into issues regarding motion to determine heirs	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.50	\$1,212.50
Review/analyze 4/10/2017 review of Jackson-Leverette appeal and follow up research involving the issues raised	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.00	\$1,455.00
Communicate (other external) 4/10/2017 call with Jobu counsel regarding issues with Koppelman	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Review/analyze 4/11/2017 review and comment on motion to determine heirs, follow up conversations with other heirs counsel about potential issues.	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.20	\$1,552.00
Communicate (other external) 4/12/2017 email correspondence with Kane regarding heirship and fee appeals	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Draft/revise 4/13/2017 review and research final issues concerning appointment of heirs	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Review/analyze 5/1/2017 review BN letter motion to dismiss concerning money paid to BN for tribute, follow up research about potential arguments against the motion	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.90	\$921.50
Review/analyze 5/3/2017 review Leverette and BNs objections to determine heirs, follow up research on potential arguments, review Spear statement of claim	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.40	\$1,649.00
Review/analyze 5/3/2017 review and comment on final reply in support of motion to determine heirs follow up discussion with other heirs attorneys regarding the same	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.10	\$1,018.50
Communicate (other external) 5/3/2017 review emails from Comerica regarding sale of Turks and Caicos follow up communications with Comerica regarding potential issues	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 5/4/2017 Review and respond to emails from Comerica regarding Heirship and review April 25 heir meeting minutes	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.20	\$582.00
Draft/revise 5/4/2017 review and revise reply motion to determine heirship and follow up communication with other heirs counsel as well emails regarding timing to serve objection to subpoena	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.30	\$1,115.50
Review/analyze 5/5/2017 review and edit changes made to BN appeal of respondents joint brief, also review order for determining heirs and affidavits of Baker and Bakers counsel regarding Subpoena	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.30	\$1,115.50
Communicate (other external) 5/8/2017 review licensing request from Comerica for Sony, go over Paisley Park accounting information, review and comment on McMillan claims of confidentiality with his agreements, review email concerning real estate sale by Comerica, also work on letter to Ms Williams and emails regarding the same, also compose email regarding filing of BN respondents brief, as well as emails regarding wrongful death counsel	jabruntjen	\$485.00	3.20	\$1,552.00
Review/analyze 5/19/2017 review order determining heirs, and analyze issues involving confidentiality of McMillan agreement, email with Comerica about public announcement of heir determinacy	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.40	\$679.00
Review/analyze 5/23/2017 review emails from Baker counsel to Comerica, review and respond to emails from Comerica about publicity on determining heirs as well as emails with Atcock regarding certain heirs receiving real estate	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Communicate (other external) 6/30/2017 draft and respond to emails from Comerica regarding Bremers work concerning looking into a will	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Review/analyze 7/17/2017 review notice of appeal for BN and other recent court filings	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Communicate (other external) 7/18/2017 review and respond to emails regarding BN appeal	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Review/analyze 7/20/2017 review appellate court order and notice of deficiency	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Communicate (other external) 7/21/2017 review and follow up on Kane email regarding argument for BN appeal	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Appear for/attend 7/24/2017 prepare for and attend meeting with Fred Law concerning BN appeal, follow up research issues regarding same	jabruntjen	\$485.00	4.20	\$2,037.00
Communicate (other external) 7/25/2017 call with Baker Counsel regarding BN appeal and WD retainer issues	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.70	\$339.50
Review/analyze 7/28/2017 review order approving PR fees, order granting Comerica access to marriage dissolution, declaration of E. Unger, memo in support to dismiss claim	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Review/analyze 8/3/2017 review transcript of May 10 hearing regarding BN court, research issues regarding same, review SSA paperwork	jabruntjen	\$485.00	2.40	\$1,164.00
Review/analyze 8/25/2017 review court transcript for April 7 appeal hearing	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Review/analyze 9/5/2017 review appellate decision upholding application of parentage act in regards to Gresham and Leverette appeal	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.50	\$727.50
Review/analyze 9/11/2017 review BN appeal decision	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Communicate (other external) 9/15/2017 email correspondence with Comerica and other heirs counsel regarding stipulation to dismiss BN appeal	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.90	\$436.50
Review/analyze 10/4/2017 review Parkhurst petition for review with Supreme Court	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.00	\$485.00
Appear for/attend 10/5/2017 call with Kane regarding next of Kin Case	jabruntjen	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
Review/analyze 10/28/2017 review and comment draft opposition to BV petition for review	jabruntjen	\$485.00	1.30	\$630.50

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Communicate (other external) 11/17/2017 emails with Fred Law concerning heirs participation in future meetings	jabrunten	\$485.00	0.50	\$242.50
			Time Entries Total	104.60
				\$50,731.00

Total (USD)	\$50,731.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$50,731.00

Subtractions and Addtions to work Performed Regarding Heirship**Subtractions**

Date	Work Performed	Rate	Hours worked	Total Charged
3/30/17	review and respond to emails regarding Prince Loans	\$485.00	0.2	\$97.00
4/3/17	email correspondnce with Comerica regarding media inquiry and statements to be made	\$485.00	1	\$485.00
4/10/17	call with Jobu Counsel regarding Koppelman	\$485.00	0.5	\$242.50
5/3/17	review emails from Comerica regarding T&C sale	\$485.00	1	\$485.00
5/8/17	review licensing request from Comerica for Sony, go over PP accounting info review and comment on McMillan claims of confidentiality with his agreements, review email cncerning real estate sale by Comerica, work on letter to Williams and emails regarding same, and emails regarding wrongful death	\$485.00	2.5	\$1,212.50
5/10/17	prepare for and attend motion hearing to determine heirs	\$485.00		
7/28/17	review order apprving PR fees, memo in support to dismiss claims	\$485.00	1	\$485.00
10/5/17	call with Kane regarding Kin case	\$485.00	0.5	\$242.50
11/17/17	emails with fred law cncerning heirs participation in future meetings	\$485.00	0.5	\$242.50
Total Subtractions			7.2	\$3,492.00

Additions

3/3/17	work on heirs protocol in regards to PR	\$485	0.3	\$145.50
3/17/17	prepare for and attend curt call and follow up research on issues addressed including on heirship and protocols	\$485	3	\$1,455
4/20/17	review Williams documents and correspndenc frm Judge Eide	\$485	0.5	\$243
5/10/17	prepare for and attend motion hearing to determine heirs	\$485	6	\$2,910
7/8/17	review Elliot exhibits	\$485	0.2	\$97
7/26/17	prepare for and attend court regarding BN appeal	\$485	2.7	\$1,310
5/26/18	review letter regarding heirhsip	\$485	0.5	\$243

Total Additions

12.9 \$6,014

Original Total of Heirship f \$50,731.00

Subtracted Amount \$3,492.00

Added Amount \$6,014

New Total \$53,253.00

Exhibit B

Invoice For Services Related To UMG**Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson**

Date	Work Completed	Rate	Hours	Total
2/1/17	Send and review emails regarding	\$485.00	1	485
2/1/17	call with co counsel regarding UMG	\$485.00	1	485
2/3/17	review documents regarding UMG	\$485.00	2.3	1115.5
2/7/17	review and comment on newest draft of UMG consultant agreement	\$485.00	2.4	1164
2/7/17	call with FW regarding UMG	\$485.00	0.9	436.5
2/7/17	call with heirs counsel regarding consulting agreement and follow up	\$485.00	1.2	582
2/7/17	review and respond to emails from from other heirs attorneys regarding	\$485.00	1.2	582
2/8/17	review key provision chart of UMG	\$485.00	2.5	1212.5
2/13/17	emails regarding UMG consultancy	\$485.00	0.7	339.5
2/15/17	review issues regarding potential UMG and WB conflict in UMG deal	\$485.00	4.2	2037
2/21/17	review and flow up to final UMG consulting agreement, emails with	\$485.00	2	970
2/21/17	call with FW about UMG consultant	\$485.00	1.3	630.5
4/5/17	correspondence with Fred Law and Comerica regarding UMG rescission and other potential issues regarding	\$485.00	1.4	679
4/5/17	look over letter from UMG and research potential claims with WB	\$485.00	2.5	1212.5

4/6/17	work on potential issues with UMG	\$485.00	3	1455
4/7/17	review letter from UMG regarding rescission and research related issues	\$485.00	2.9	1406.5
4/19/17	prepare for and attend phone call with court regarding UMG and WB	\$485.00	2.7	1309.5
4/26/17	review and respond to Comerica's emails regarding rescission of UMG agreement follow up	\$485.00	3.6	1746
4/27/17	review correspondence with Comerica regarding WB's position	\$485.00	0.5	242.5
5/1/17	review UMG deal and research issues regarding conflicting rights with WB	\$485.00	3.5	1697.5
5/5/17	correspondence regarding motion to	\$485.00	0.5	242.5
5/11/17	review Dahl letter and Comerica	\$485.00	1	485
5/17/17	review Comerica paperwork regarding UMG rescission and exhibits ,follow up	\$485.00	3.7	1794.5
5/18/17	review letter from Bassford to court	\$485.00	0.5	242.5
5/18/17	review and draft emails to Comerica	\$485.00	0.8	388
5/19/17	review letter from SNJ attorneys concerning UMG and follow up with	\$485.00	2.3	1115.5
5/22/17	review letter from Strang and exchange emails with fredlaw	\$485.00	1	485
5/22/17	meeting at Cozen regarding UMG	\$485.00	5.4	2619
5/23/17	review letter from Stinson regarding	\$485.00	0.5	242.5
5/24/17	analyze letter from Fred Law regarding SNJ and McMillan's letter	\$485.00	0.7	339.5

5/27/17	review WB letter to Comerica and follow up research regarding same	\$485.00	2.5	1212.5
5/31/17	review financials from Bremer regarding Stinson fees with UMG	\$485.00	2.1	1018.5
5/31/17	prepare for and attend meeting with Fred Law and heirs counsel about	\$485.00	3.5	1697.5
6/1/17	review and comment on Baker motion supporting rescission, further research	\$485.00	3.5	1697.5
6/3/17	review and respond to emails regarding Bremer discharge and UMG	\$485.00	0.8	388
6/5/17	review and respond to emails from Baker counsel and SLS regarding UMG	\$485.00	1.4	679
6/7/17	review and respond to emails concerning UMG call and prior rights agreement concerns, research related issues. Also emails from Comerica and	\$485.00	2.3	1115.5
6/7/17	prepare for and attend court call regarding rescission and other issues	\$485.00	3	1455
6/7/17	meeting with Fred Law regarding	\$485.00	2.2	1067
6/8/17	review memo and affidavit opposing	\$485.00	1	485
6/10/17	review Dahl letter, Comerica paperwork supporting rescission, UMG reply in support of rescission, Baker paperwork supporting	\$485.00	4	1940
6/12/17	review Comerica letter regarding UMG	\$485.00	0.6	291
6/13/17	prepare for and attend court hearing	\$485.00	5.7	2764.5
6/15/17	review protective order and order giving UMG 2014 WB agreement,	\$485.00	1	485

6/20/17	call with Comerica and other parties regarding rescission of UMG deal,	\$485.00	3.5	1697.5
6/23/17	review emails McMillan and Comerica emails regarding UMG rescission	\$485.00	1.4	679
6/26/17	review emails from Kane and Comerica regarding McMillan's actions concerning UMG deal and	\$485.00	1.2	582
6/27/17	review letter from UMG attorneys regarding rescission and follow up	\$485.00	2.3	1115.5
6/28/17	review Silver and McMillan emails regarding UMG agreement, follow up	\$485.00	1	485
6/29/17	review letter from Dahl regarding UMG agreement, letter from Silver,	\$485.00	1.2	582
6/30/17	review letter from UMG to court and letter from Silver to Curt regarding	\$485.00	2.5	1212.5
7/5/17	Williams letter in response to UMG and letter from Fred Law to court	\$485.00	0.5	242.5
7/13/17	review order approving rescission, look into possible appealable issues	\$485.00	3	1455
TOTAL			107.4	\$52,089.00

