

# EXHIBIT A

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW1
Issue Date	4/21/16
Due Date	5/31/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Communicate (with client)</b> 4/24/16 call with client on estate matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Draft/revise</b> 4/23/16 initial meeting with client, draft retainer, consultation	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (with client)</b> 4/25/16 call with client on estate matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 4/25/16 review initial court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.8	\$2,016.00
<b>Other</b> 4/26/16 travel LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Research</b> 4/26/16 applicable Minnesota Estate law	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 4/27/16 call with Bremer, other counsel, prepare for a and debrief	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b> 4/27/16 meeting with client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 4/27/16 review new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 4/28/16 cert. of rep	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (with client)</b> 4/29/16 meeting with clients	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 4/29/16 review new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.9	\$1,368.00
<b>Research</b> 4/29/16 applicable law involving case	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00

<b>Communicate (with client)</b>					
4/30/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00	
meeting with client and other work to prep him for court					
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
4/30/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00	
meeting with JB about initial case procedure					
<b>Draft/revise</b>					
5/1/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00	
initial filing documents and read over any potential case filings, research applicable Minnesota Law					
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
5/1/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00	
new case filing					
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>					
5/1/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.9	\$1,368.00	
first court appearance					
<b>Appear for/attend</b>					
5/2/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00	
meeting with client and counsel					
<b>Appear for/attend</b>					
5/2/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.2	\$3,744.00	
first court appearance					
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
5/2/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00	
review court filings and other paper work					
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/3/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00	
calls with other counsel					
<b>Appear for/attend</b>					
5/3/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00	
meeting with client about procedure of case, timelines, and all other issues including heirship					
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/3/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00	
review and respond to various emails including filing issues, court procedure, Parkhurst, and JB about initial case filings					
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
5/3/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00	
conversation with JB about Parkhurst case					
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/4/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00	
meetings with other counsel and clients, review and revise Pro Hac Vice documents					
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
5/4/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00	
conversation with JB about Estate issues and procedure after initial paperwork					
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/4/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00	
meeting with beneficiaries counsel					

<b>Other</b>				
5/5/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
travel MSP to LAX				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/5/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
meetings with clients follow up and other calls with other counsel				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
5/5/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
review pro hac vice motion				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/5/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
call with Brian Dillon and follow up				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
5/6/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
review court filings				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/6/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
meeting with JB about tribute				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/6/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
status conference with court				
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>				
5/7/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
meeting with possible concert promoters and producers follow up				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/7/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/8/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
meeting with JB and possible producers for tribute				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
call with JB about tribute matters				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
5/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
court filings				
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>				
5/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
meeting with city of Minneapolis				
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>				
5/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
meeting with heirs counsel about tribute				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>other</b>				
5/10/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
travel LAX to MSP				
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>				
5/10/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
tribute meeting with heirs counsel				

<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/10/16					
review and respond to various emails including emails to LA mayor, star tribune, and city of Minneapolis about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/10/16					
telephone conference with possible tribute sponsors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
5/10/16					
conversation with JB about tribute meetings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
5/11/16					
new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/11/16					
meeting with city of Minneapolis and present tribute idea	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/11/16					
meeting with heirs counsel and present tribute ideas	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00	
<b>other</b>					
5/12/16					
travel MSP to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/12/16					
call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
5/12/16					
meeting with JB about tribute and Estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/13/16					
court call	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
5/13/16					
meeting with JB about tribute issues and presenting proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/14/16					
call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	1800	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
5/14/16					
phone call with possible tribute sponsors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
5/14/16					
new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00	

<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/14/16 conversation with JB regarding parentage and heirship	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/15/16 conversation with JB about new case filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Research</b>				
5/16/16 review all case filings up to date and research new estate issues with SA	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/16/16 conversation with JB about sponsors for tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/17/16 call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
5/17/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/17/16 review and respond to various emails including Star Tribune and other media, Paisley Park, SA, and letter to possible investors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/17/16 conversation with JB about tribute and sale of estate assets	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
5/18/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.6	\$1,152.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/18/16 conversation with JB about tribute investors and sponsors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/18/16 conversation with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/19/16 conversation with JB about tribute proposals and what changes to make to our tribute proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/20/16 court call	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/20/16 call with JB about estate assets	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00

<b>Review/analyze</b> 5/21/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 5/21/16 call with JB about fathom events	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/22/16 call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/23/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.4	\$1,008.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 5/23/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.1	\$1,512.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/24/16 review and respond to various emails including with JB about investors for tribute, possible buyers of estate, Parkhurst client issues, and DNA testing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/25/16 call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 5/25/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 5/25/16 conversation with JB about tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 5/26/16 new court filings and research	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/26/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/27/16 call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 5/27/16 call with JB about other tribute proposals	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/27/16 court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 5/30/16 call with tribute producers/ sponsors/ consultants	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00

<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
5/31/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
call with JB about tribute issues				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
5/31/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
review and respond to various emails about SA genetic protocol, preserving digital info, and with other heirs counsel about tribute and estate matters				
			Time Entries	
			Total	206.7
				\$148,824.00

Subtotal \$148,824.00

Total \$148,824.00

Paid \$0.00

Balance \$148,824.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW2
Issue Date	6/1/16
Due Date	6/30/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/1/16 court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/1/16 call with JB about tribute matters and Atomic proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/1/16 proposals for tribute and other tribute matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/2/16 new court filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.4	\$1,008.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/2/16 court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.6	\$2,592.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/2/16 call with JB about about monetization experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/2/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/3/16 call with JB about tribute issues and new estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/3/16 aff. of publication, ABC News, MPR request	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/3/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/5/16 call with JB about tribute and other investors for concert	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/5/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.8	\$576.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/6/16 call with JB about potential buyers for estate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/6/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/7/16 review demand for notice- Norman Corthens, Order approving Protocol, Douglas Peterson correspondence, order sealing aff., order for hearing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				

6/7/16 court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Plan and prepare for</b> 6/7/16 motion hearing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.1	\$1,512.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/7/16 review and respond to various emails including monetization experts, medical examiner reports, other heirs counsel, and JB	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.6	\$2,592.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/8/16 call with JB about client affidavit and getting the correct paperwork	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Draft/revise</b> 6/8/16 proposed order	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/9/16 call with JB about tribute matter	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/9/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.9	\$1,368.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/9/16 proposed order authorizing experts, KSTP amended notice, Carlin Williams proposed order, redlined copy of proposed order, written statement of claim, order for experts, order authorizing experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/9/16 client affidavit	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/10/16 call with JB about new estate issues and heirship concerns	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/10/16 Motes demand, aff. of heirship, Earle Aff.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/10/16 court conference call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/11/16 calls with SA, and other producers about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/13/16 call with JB about tribute venue and other related issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/13/16 Dixon dec., aff of mailing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 6/14/16 call with JB about experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 6/14/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.7	\$1,224.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 6/14/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.7	\$1,224.00

amended COR, affidavit of heirship, other documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.7	\$1,227.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/14/16 review and respond to various emails including genetic testing protocol, affidavit issues, legal paperwork for clients affidavit, emails with other heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.8	\$3,456.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/15/16 call with JB about client affidavit and tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/15/16 calls with SA about tribute, possible sponsors, and producers	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/16/16 call with JB about media requests in courtroom and procedure	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/17/16 call with JB about fathom events offers and other possible sponsors or investors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/17/16 KSTP amended notice, Pro Hac Motion, Order, Affidavits	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/17/16 call with court	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/17/16 misc. documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/18/16 call with JB about outstanding estate issues and experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/18/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/19/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/20/16 call with JB about protocol from SA	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/20/16 calls about tribute and other consultants on the same	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/21/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/17/16 misc. documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/18/16 call with JB about outstanding estate issues and experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/18/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00

call with tribute consultant				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/19/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/20/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
call with JB about protocol from SA				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/20/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
calls about tribute and other consultants on the same				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/21/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
call with JB about tribute				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/21/16				
order sealing heirship, memo in support of objection to protocol, affidavits of heirship, notice of demand, Star Tribute. Corr,	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/21/16				
review and respond to various emails including Parentage act issues, other heirs counsel, and SA concerns	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.2	\$3,024.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/22/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
call with JB about parentage act and tribute ideas and SA advisors				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/22/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/22/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
new filed documents				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/23/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
pro hoc vice order				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/24/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
call with JB about genetic testing				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/24/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
misc. documents				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/25/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
calls with tribute producers, sponsors and other consultants				
<b>Appear for/attend</b>				
6/26/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
meeting with JB and Randy Phillips and other tribute producers				
<b>Research</b>				
6/26/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
media coalition issues				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/26/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
call with JB about media				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/26/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/27/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
call with JB about media coalition				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/27/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00

Dixon declaration

<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/28/16				
review and respond to various emails including emails with JB about media and SA experts, tribute consultants and other issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/29/16				
call with JB about tribute financing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
6/29/16				
newly filed documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/29/16				
calls with tribute producers, other people to advise on tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
6/30/16				
call with JB about tribute financing, sponsors, and other possible acts to perform	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
6/30/16				
call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.9	\$2,088.00

Time Entries

Expense	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>other</b>				
6/26/16				
Dinner with JB and tribute producers, SOHO House Los Angeles	Frank Wheaton	\$245.00	1	\$245.00
Expenses Total				\$245.00

Subtotal	\$95,573.00
Total	\$95,573.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$95,573.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW3
Issue Date	7/1/16
Due Date	7/31/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/1/16 call with JB about tribute issues including financing and venue as well as SA experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.3	\$1,656.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/1/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/1/16 call with beneficiary counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/2/16 call with JB revenue streams for tribute and venue for tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/3/16 call with JB about parentage act and other estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.8	\$576.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/4/16 call with JB about tribute concerns and problems arising from experts/SAs actions on tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.4	\$1,008.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/4/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/5/16 call with JB about tribute sponsors and performers, and revenue streams	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/5/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/5/16				

read and respond to various emails, SA and heirs counsel about tribute matters, revenue numbers for tribute, financial commitment letter for tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.3	\$3,096.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/5/16 teleconference with all counsel and beneficiary counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/6/16 call with JB about tribute financing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Review/analyze**

7/6/16 correspondence to judge, boy affidavit, foster order, amended order, Hensen Effron	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/7/16 call with JB about tribute venue and US bank stadium	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
--	---------------	----------	---	----------

**Review/analyze**

7/7/16 objection to protocol, SA's determination	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/8/16 call with JB about objections to protocol and certification of heirs	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Research**

7/8/16 possible wrongful death claims	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.3	\$3,816.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/8/16 phone call with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/9/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Appear for/attend**

7/10/16 meeting with possible tribute producers and sponsors	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/12/16 call with JB about wrongful death claim	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/12/16				
---------	--	--	--	--

read and respond to various emails for protocol objections, adjudication heirs, emails with other counsel and with JB about tribute matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/14/16 call with JB about genetic testing and other issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.7	\$1,224.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/14/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.7	\$1,944.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Review/analyze**

7/16/16 Crosby aff., SA's memo of law to support protocol, Leverette memo, beneficiary affidavits, objection BN	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/17/16 calls with investors for tribute and presentation of tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.5	\$4,680.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/18/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/19/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

7/19/16 review and respond to various emails , SA plans for memorial, other heirs counsel concerns about estate issues, JB emails about Estate matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Review/analyze**

7/19/16 motion for adm., Pro Hac Vice	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Appear for/attend**

7/20/16 meeting with possible tribute producers and financing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/20/16 call with JB about estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Communicate (in firm)**

7/21/16 call with JB memorial plans	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Review/analyze**

7/21/16	response to SA, affidavit of heirship, denial for notice, Krishnan affidavit, order adopting protocol, and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.6	\$4,752.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
7/22/16	call with JB estate issue discussion	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
7/22/16	court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
7/23/16	demand for notice, order sealing affidavit, Pro Hac Vice, cert of rep, Claire Nelson affidavit, demand for notice	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
7/24/16	call with JB about tribute concerns, clients statement promoting tribute, and other tribute concerns	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
7/25/16	call with JB about affidavit of heirship	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
7/25/16	call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
7/25/16	demand for notice, notice of appearance, joint petition, follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
7/26/16	call with JB about appointment of PR	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
7/26/16	call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.6	\$1,152.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
7/26/16	review and respond to various emails, appointment of PR, family event with heirs counsel and other counsel for claimants, U of M tribute and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.8	\$2,736.00
<b>Research</b>					
7/27/16	media coalition issues and other follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>					

7/27/16 Peterson, memo in support of media, modified protocol for business,	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/28/16 call with JB about business protocol	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.1	\$792.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/29/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Research</b>				
7/29/16 Media rights	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
7/30/16 call with JB about estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
7/30/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
7/30/16 genetic testing order, hearing and judgement, SA fees documents,	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Research</b>				
7/31/16 fees for special administrator	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.4	\$3,168.00

## Time Entries

Total	130.9	\$94,248.00
-------	-------	-------------

Subtotal	\$94,248.00
----------	-------------

Total	\$94,248.00
-------	-------------

Paid	\$0.00
------	--------

Balance	\$94,248.00
---------	-------------

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW4
Issue Date	8/1/16
Due Date	8/31/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/1/16 call with JB about Abdo call with SA and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/1/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/2/16 call with JB about will for Mattie	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/2/16  review and respond to various emails including SA issues with Matties will, Gislason notes on SA call, U of M tribute and various communications with other heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/3/16 call with JB about Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/4/16 misc new filings and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Research</b>				
8/4/16 real estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/5/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/5/16 Ordahl and Krishnan Aff.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/5/16 court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.8	\$2,016.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/6/16 call with JB about Paisley Park deal structure	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.9	\$648.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/6/16 SA memo in Support	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/7/16 call with JB about Paisley Park including issues with tour for client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/7/16 call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/8/16 call with JB Paisley Park issues and follow up, outstanding tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.4	\$1,008.00

<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/9/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
call with tribute consultant				
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/9/16				
review and respond to various emails including SA issues, Real Estate sales of, communications with beneficiaries counsel about Paisley Park tour and agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/9/16				
motion to dismiss, sealing tests, entry judgement, other documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/10/16				
call with JB Paisley MOU, tribute, and consulting agreements	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Research</b>				
8/10/16				
BN/VN claims	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.6	\$2,592.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/10/16				
call with heirs counsel and SA about PP and follow up review	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Research</b>				
8/11/16				
SA's ability to sell assets	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/11/16				
call with JB about SA selling real estate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/11/16				
call with heirs counsel about Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/12/16				
call with JB regarding call with Stoltman	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/12/16				
weekly court call	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/13/16				
call with tribute consultant	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/14/16				
call with JB about tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/14/16				
Dixon memorandum, Hauck, deny forma, Leverette Obj., filing order, property docs, entry of judgement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
<b>Other</b>				
8/15/16				
travel LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/15/16				
call with JB about Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/16/16				
call with JB about tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/16/16				

review and respond to various emails including Paisley Park exhibition agreement, wrongful death claims and emails to other attorneys, other beneficiary counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.6	\$3,312.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b>				
8/16/16 meeting at Stinson prep work and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	7	\$5,040.00
<b>Other</b>				
8/17/16 travel MSP to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/17/16 call with JB Paisley Park agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/18/16 call with JB about Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/19/16 call with JB about VN/BN issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.7	\$504.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/21/16 call with JB about family meeting	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/21/16 call with other heirs counsel about initial family meeting	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
<b>Research</b>				
8/22/16 tribute and financing issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/22/16 call with JB about tribute financing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/23/16 call with JB about loans to heirs	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/23/16 review and respond to various emails including CBS request, loan requests, press release, BN discovery plan, and other heirs counsel follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.3	\$3,096.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/23/16 call with heirs counsel concerning PP and other issues, debrief	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/24/16 call with JB about advisor agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.1	\$72.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/25/16 written statement of claim, Paisley Park paperwork	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.7	\$2,664.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/26/16 call with JB about Warner proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.8	\$576.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/26/16 call with heirs counsel/SA about Warner proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
8/27/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00

BN/VN motion to reconsider, discovery plan, cert. of rep	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0	\$2,100.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/28/16 call with JB about genetic testing issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/28/16 call with heirs counsel Warner deal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	11.5	\$8,280.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/29/16 call with JB about upcoming concerts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/30/16 call with JB about SA fees and possible objections and discussion about SA experts	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/30/16 review and respond to various emails including concert issues at first ave., slides from SA meeting, settlement offer to BV and objections to WB deal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
8/30/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up on issues discussed	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
8/31/16 call with JB about estate tax issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00

Time Entries  
Total 129.8 \$93,456.00

Expense	Billed By	Price	Quantity	Subtotal
<b>other</b> 8/15/16 Plane Ticket LAX to MSP round trip	Frank Wheaton	\$400.00	1	\$400.00
<b>other</b> 8/15/16 Marquette Hotel in Minneapolis, per night	Frank Wheaton	\$300.00	2	\$600.00
<b>other</b> 8/16/16 Dinner with client and JB at Crave Minneapolis	Frank Wheaton	\$200.00	1	\$200.00
Expenses				
Total				\$1,200.00

Subtotal	\$94,656.00
Total	\$94,656.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$94,656.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW5
Issue Date	9/1/16
Due Date	9/30/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Other</b> 9/1/16 travel LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b> 9/1/16 meeting with client and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b> 9/2/16 meeting with client and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.3	\$3,096.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/2/16 call with JB about estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 9/3/16 scheduling order, alt testing, other documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.6	\$1,152.00
<b>Other</b> 9/4/16 travel MSP to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/4/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 9/6/16 review and respond to various emails including renewal of experts, job withdrawal and tribute issues, SA issues with real estate sales	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/6/16 call with JB sale of real estate by SA	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Plan and prepare for</b> 9/7/16 prepare for court and review of case filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 9/7/16 call with consultant on tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 9/7/16 call with heirs and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/7/16 call with JB about SA experts agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.9	\$648.00
<b>Other</b> 9/8/16 travel LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 9/8/16 calls with heirs group and follow up on issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Research</b> 9/8/16 looked into objections to advisor agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/8/16 call with JB about advisor agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b> 9/9/16 Prepare for and attend meeting at Carver County court	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
<b>Other</b> 9/10/16 travel MSP to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 9/11/16 SA's bills, BV challenges, and other documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.6	\$1,872.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/11/16 call with Jb regarding SA's fees	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/12/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00

call with JB about SA fees					
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
9/13/16					
review and respond to various emails including SA fee issues, Jobu counsel and legal claims, other heirs counsel and UBS issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.6	\$2,592.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/13/16					
call with JB regarding ways to save tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/14/16					
Paisley Park issues, go over docs and agreements	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/14/16					
call with JB about tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.7	\$1,224.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/15/16					
Paisley Park documents and related issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00	
<b>Research</b>					
9/15/16					
review major deals upcoming and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/15/16					
call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/16/16					
protective order, notice of admission, affidavits, state of claims, other docs and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00	
<b>Research</b>					
9/16/16					
Advisor and Tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00	
<b>Appear for/attend</b>					
9/17/16					
meeting with JB about estate issues, including BN/VN issues, advisor agreement, and all other outstanding issues with the estate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/18/16					
disallowance of claims, other docs	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.3	\$1,656.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/18/16					
call with JB about tribute agreement and consultant issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.1	\$792.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
9/19/16					
call with consultant about tribute issues and figure out fix.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.9	\$2,088.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/19/16					
call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.7	\$504.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/20/16					
SA fee issues and consultant agreement for tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
9/20/16					
review and respond to various emails including heirs counsel issues with tribute, advisor agreement, video issues for tribute, other tribute expenditures, tribute MOU	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/20/16					
call with JB about tribute and video expense for tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/21/16					
Dixon Docs, and SA fee issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.9	\$2,088.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/21/16					
call with JB with UBS, SA advisor agreement, and other tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00	
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>					
9/22/16					
call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00	
<b>Review/analyze</b>					
9/23/16					
concert issues and Paisley Park agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	7	\$5,040.00	
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>					
9/23/16					
court call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00	

<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/23/16 call with JB about Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.1	\$792.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/24/16 call with JB about tribute agreement and SA fees	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 9/25/16 fee objection briefs and have conversations with other counsel about same	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.9	\$2,088.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/25/16 call with JB about fee objections	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/26/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.1	\$792.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 9/27/16 review and respond to various emails including, objections to advisor agreement, tribute consultant agreement, other heirs counsel emails and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.2	\$3,024.00
<b>Research</b> 9/27/16 appellate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.3	\$2,376.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 9/27/16 High Q documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.1	\$2,232.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/27/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/28/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/29/16 call with JB about advisor agreement and tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 9/30/16 HK filings docs, appeals, Boyd paperwork, other docs and SA paperwork	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 9/30/16 call with JB regarding client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Time Entries</b>				
Total			136.6	\$98,352.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Price	Quantity	Subtotal
<b>other</b> 9/1/16 Plane ticket from LAX to MSP round trip	Frank Wheaton	\$400.00	1	\$400.00
<b>other</b> 9/1/16 Marquette Hilton in Minneapolis, per night	Frank Wheaton	\$250.00	3	\$750.00
<b>other</b> 9/16/16 Dinner with JB Los Angeles	Frank Wheaton	\$135.00	1	\$135.00
<b>Expense</b>				
Total				\$1,285.00

Subtotal	\$99,637.00
Total	\$99,637.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$99,637.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW6
Issue Date	10/1/16
Due Date	10/31/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
10/1/16 deal with tribute issues and Paisley Park agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/2/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/2/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/3/16 call with JB upcoming tribute meeting	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Research</b>				
10/4/16 tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/4/16 call with JB about tribute	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.7	\$504.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/4/16 review and respond to various emails in regards to tribute, consulting agreement, entertainment deals order, SA advisor issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.3	\$3,096.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
10/5/16 Elliot paperwork, scheduling order and other	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.4	\$3,168.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b>				
10/5/16 meeting with client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/5/16 call with JB about BN/VN negotiations and tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.6	\$1,152.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b>				
10/6/16 Paisley Park Tour with Client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.5	\$4,680.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/6/16 call with JB about Paisley Park tour	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Research</b>				
10/9/16 BN issues and. review documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				

10/10/16 call with JB about BN issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/11/16 review and respond to various emails regarding Paisley Park and Consultancy agreement, loan issues, Press release PP, tribute issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
10/12/16 Tribute and Bravado agreement and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b>				
10/13/16 meeting with client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/14/16 call with JB about tribute issues and Simmons submissions	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
10/16/16 review new filings including Dixon memo, SA order, VN documents and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/17/16 conference with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.4	\$1,728.00
<b>Research</b>				
10/18/16 new fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.4	\$3,888.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/18/16 read and answer emails tribute issues, SA brief on VN, Paisley Park and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/20/16 calls with possible fiduciaries, follow up and debrief	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/20/16 call with JB about client and Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/24/16 call with JB about VN issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
10/25/16 Hughes claim, Simmons paperwork, VN memo, and other documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.2	\$3,744.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
10/25/16 call with JB about fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.3	\$936.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
10/25/16 review and respond to various emails regarding fiduciary issues, follow up with heirs counsel, tribute settlement, Parkhurst client, and appeals issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.9	\$3,528.00

<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 10/27/16 call with JB about appeal issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 10/28/16 call with Jb about consulting payments, appeals and fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 10/29/16 call with JB about client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 10/30/16 High Q documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.8	\$2,736.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 10/31/16 new court filings and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 10/31/16 heirs call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 10/31/16 call with JB about fiduciaries	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
Time Entries				
Total			106.3	\$76,536.00

Exoense	Billed By	Price	Quantity	Subtotal
<b>other</b> 10/11/16 Plane Ticket from LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$300.00	1	\$300.00
<b>other</b> 10/11/16 Marquette Hotel in Minneapolis, per night	Frank Wheaton	\$250.00	3	\$750.00
<b>other</b> 10/12/16 Paisley Park tour with client and other heirs group, per ticket	Frank Wheaton	\$38.50	4	\$154.00
Expenses				
Total				\$1,204.00

Subtotal	\$77,740.00
Total	\$77,740.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$77,740.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW7
Issue Date	11/1/16
Due Date	11/30/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 11/1/16 call with JB consulting agreements Paisley	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/1/16 review and respond to various emails regarding Paisley Park, issues with Vault, inventory of estate assets, order for experts, and fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/1/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 11/2/16 call with JB about consulting agreements	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 11/3/16 call with JB about ROC nation issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/3/16 call with JB and clients	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/4/16 court conference and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 11/5/16 call with JB about order for revised protocol	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 11/6/16 order denying reconsider. , testing order, transcript, other heirship documents, High Q docs and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 11/7/16 call with JB about filing letter withdrawing support	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.1	\$792.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/7/16 call with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 11/8/16 review and respond to various emails including issues with filing of motion, drafting letter, filing letter explaining issues, fiduciary issues, correspondence with numerous heirs counsel, emails with JB about filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				

11/9/16 call with JB about PR successors and fiduciaries	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/10/16 call with JB about corporate trustees	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
11/11/16 testing objections, order for testing, other entertainment contracts, other court filings and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.2	\$3,744.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/12/16 call with JB about Paisley Park press release	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.4	\$288.00
<b>Research</b>				
11/13/16 fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/14/16 call with JB about appeals claims, joint protocol issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/14/16 call with other counsel, follow up on fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/15/16 review and respond to various emails including SAs joint protocol, UBS and other heirs counsel correspondence	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.4	\$3,168.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
11/15/16 disallowance of claims, substitution of counsel, and other document	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/16/16 call with JB about AMA's for client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/17/16 call with JB about Roc Nation Infringement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/17/16 conference call and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
11/19/16 misc court filings and other documents filed	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/21/16 call with JB about fiduciary interviews	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/22/16 call with JB about twitter campaign launch	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/22/16				

review and respond to various emails including twitter, SA proposed protocol comments and edits with heirs counsel, email with courts about filing	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
11/24/16 appeal order, fiduciary issues, and other misc documents and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.5	\$3,960.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/27/16 call with JB about Paisley celebration	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Plan and prepare for</b>				
11/28/16 fiduciary issues and meetings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/29/16 review and respond to various emails including GMR comments, edits, and other issues, fiduciary interviews and follow up with other heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.8	\$2,736.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
11/29/16 conference call with possible fiduciaries	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
11/30/16 call with JB about fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
11/30/16 all new filings to case and High documents and fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00

Time Entries		
Total	92	\$66,240.00

Subtotal	\$66,240.00
Total	\$66,240.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$66,240.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW8
Issue Date	12/1/16
Due Date	12/31/16
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Review/analyze</b> 12/3/16 GMR agreement and other new case filings, follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 12/5/16 call with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 12/5/16 call with JB about GMR	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.8	\$576.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 12/5/16 phone call LM and heirs counsel about PR issues and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6	\$4,320.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 12/6/16 call with JB about AMAs	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.2	\$144.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 12/6/16 ROC Nation documents and follow up, talk with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 12/6/16 review and respond to various emails including GMR, live performance proposal, First Tennessee issues, UPMG agreements and other correspondence with heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 12/7/16 call with JB about fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 12/8/16 call with JB about Comerica	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 12/8/16 SA paperwork, PR objections, PR other documents, and new case filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 12/9/16 call with JB about fiduciary fees	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.3	\$216.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 12/9/16 call with court and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Research</b> 12/9/16 new SA issues and fiduciary issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				

12/10/16 call with JB about client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/12/16 call with JB about regarding improving entertainment agreements	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
12/13/16 review and respond to various emails including entertainment deals, Joel W. loan docs and review, fiduciary fees	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/14/16 call with JB about Prince Act	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
12/14/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/15/16 call with JB about entertainment deals	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.8	\$576.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
12/15/16 review new case filings	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
12/15/16 call with heirs counsel and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
12/18/16 review new case filings, asset docs, and research PR issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/19/16 call with JB about client	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/20/16 call with JB regarding new PR	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.5	\$360.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
12/20/16 review and respond to various emails including estate assets, new fiduciary issues, and new PR issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/21/16 call with JB about appointing PR	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.7	\$504.00
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
12/21/16 SA paperwork, order for hearing and other new filed documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/27/16 call with JB debrief about latest issues in case	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b>				
12/27/16 review and respond to various emails including	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00

PR appointment issues, fiduciary issues and  
other follow up

<b>Research</b>				
12/27/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
fees issues and objections				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
12/27/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
fees objections and motions, SA paperwork, and other newly filed documents and follow up				
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b>				
12/29/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
call with JB about PR appointment				
<b>Review/analyze</b>				
12/30/16	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
review new filed documents and follow up, research fee issues				
			Time Entries Total	
			81.1	\$58,392.00

Subtotal \$58,392.00

Total \$58,392.00

Paid \$0.00

Balance \$58,392.00

## Frank Wheaton

## INVOICE

Bill To:  
Alfred Jackson

Number	FW9
Issue Date	1/1/17
Due Date	1/31/17
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 1/3/17 meeting with Coamerica and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 1/3/17 call with JB about meeting with comerica	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 1/3/17 review and respond to various emails including PR appointment, planning for court, comerica issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 1/4/17 call with JB about PR appointment	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 1/5/17 call with JB about client matters and PR	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.4	\$1,008.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 1/5/17 call with comerica and other heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 1/6/17 new case filings, sub of counsel, Estate inventory, protective order, SA invoice, and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.5	\$3,240.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 1/8/17 call with JB about prep for court	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
<b>Communicate (in firm)</b> 1/9/17 call with JB about court coming up and other estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.8	\$1,296.00
<b>Appear for/attend</b> 1/9/17 meeting with JB about PR issues, loans, and court	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
<b>Other</b> 1/9/17 travel LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
<b>Communicate (other external)</b> 1/10/17 review and respond to various emails including loan documents and issues, additions to loan documents, emails with JB about court	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.4	\$2,448.00
<b>Review/analyze</b> 1/10/17				

attorney fee requests, Baker and Nelson court filings, SA filings, and other PR paperwork	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
---	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Review/analyze**

1/10/17 client loan documents and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Appear for/attend**

1/10/17 meeting at Paisley Park	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5	\$3,600.00
------------------------------------	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Appear for/attend**

1/10/17 meeting with co-counsel about court, loan documents and the PR issue	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
---	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Plan and prepare for**

1/11/17 prepare for court and review issues about PR and loan documents and meet with client and have them sign documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	8	\$5,760.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Appear for/attend**

1/12/17 attend court in Carver County and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	8	\$5,760.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

1/12/17 call with JB and Greg Walker	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
---	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Other**

1/13/17 travel MSP to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4	\$2,880.00
------------------------------	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/14/17 call with JB about loan issues and client matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1	\$720.00
--	---------------	----------	---	----------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/17/17 call with JB about PR issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	0.6	\$432.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Communicate (other external)**

1/17/17 review and respond to various emails including PR issues, court related matters, UMG agreement, estate matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
---	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Review/analyze**

1/17/17 New Baker and Nelson filings, all other newly filed documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.5	\$2,520.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/21/17 call with JB about client matters and entertainment deals	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.5	\$1,800.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/23/17 call with JB regarding attorney fees and other estate issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.5	\$1,080.00
---	---------------	----------	-----	------------

**Review/analyze**

1/23/17 new case filings and courts orders and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
---	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

1/24/17				
---------	--	--	--	--

review and respond to various emails including estate updates, Comerica status and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/27/17 call with JB about UMG comments and edits	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	1.2	\$864.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	----------

**Review/analyze**

1/28/17 all new case filings and review of Judges order	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3	\$2,160.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (in firm)**

1/29/17 call with JB about filing documents under seal, comerica status and matters regarding new fiduciary	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2	\$1,440.00
--	---------------	----------	---	------------

**Communicate (other external)**

1/31/17 review and respond to various emails regarding filing documents under seal, emails with court and other beneficiaries	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.2	\$2,304.00
--	---------------	----------	-----	------------

## Time Entries

Total	94.1	\$67,752.00
-------	------	-------------

Expense	Billed By	Price	Quantity	Subtotal
<b>Other</b> 1/9/17 Plane ticket LAX to MSP	Frank Wheaton	\$350.00	1	\$350.00
<b>Other</b> 1/9/17 Marquette Hotel MSP per night	Frank Wheaton	\$250.00	2	\$500.00
Expense Total				\$850.00

Subtotal	\$68,602.00
Total	\$68,602.00
Paid	\$0.00
Balance	\$68,602.00

## justin Bruntjen

justin@b2lawyers.com  
O: 6122426313

## INVOICE

Number	12
Issue Date	11/1/2016
Due Date	11/30/2016
Email	alfredjackson@yahoo.com

## Bill To:

Alfred Jackson

## Time Entries

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Sub
Review/analyze 9/27/2016 Review of memoranda and notes from HiQ Conversations with other counsel regarding Entertainment/Estate related matters. Conversations with Steve Silton, Ken Abdo, Bob Labate, Adam Giselson, Stinson and Holland & Knight, etc. Dealing with motions, objections, conflicts, etc.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 9/30/2016 Entertainment meetings and discussions regarding the music contracts with Prince. Conversations with advisors, lawyers, Review of contracts with other entertainment counsel. Further discussion of protocol. Preparation of certain memos and emails regarding music contracts.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.50	\$4,680.00
Communicate (other external) 9/30/2016 Discussion with Stinson/Bremer regarding memorial concert and other entertainment related activities. Final review of Paisley Park materials. Conversations with Abdo, Giselson Silton and other lawyers regarding protocol.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.00	\$4,320.00
Communicate (other external) 10/2/2016 Conference calls with counsel of Non-Excluded Heirs. Discussions regarding music contracts, potential settlements, Paisley Park and memorial concert. Review of long-draft Agreements for music contracts.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/3/2016 Review and discussions of current music industry long-form contracts. Several discussions with other counsel regarding strategy, settlements and discussions regarding Brianna's matter.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/4/2016 Conference calls carryover with Non-Excluded Heirs and discussions of the long-form settlements and agreements Concert Tribute approaching – discussions continue.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/4/2016 Conference calls and email exchanges with counsel, conversations with Bremer/Stinson on concert particulars.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.00	\$2,880.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Cost
Communicate (other external) 10/4/2016 Conference calls with heirs' counsel. Bob Labate, Ken Abdo and I discuss and review protocol, music contracts and advisor comments – Charles Koppelman and Londell McMillan	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/4/2016 Moving forward with conversations with other lawyers to discuss the same strategy and other plans. Several opportunities on the table for music deals including Universal, Sirius, Warner Brothers, Spotify, Apple are discussed with several counsel members.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 10/5/2016 Preparation for negotiations, review of contracts for: The Warner Bros. Records Amendment dated September 7, 2016; Sirius, UMG, WB Masters, Vault Masters, UMG Publishing Administration, Bravado	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/6/2016 Conference call with Advisors, Special Administrator Long-form contract review, miscellaneous issues Conference calls with heirs' counsel, Conference with Advisor Charles Koppelman	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 10/7/2016 Review of Authentic merchandising deal letter. 4.5 Review of Amended Court Order of SA motion to approve deals. Bravado Long-Form Agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Review/analyze 10/10/2016 Preparation of UMG deal comments and conference calls with Heirs' Counsel. Review of Advisor Charles Koppelman affidavit – October 19, 2016 meeting	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/10/2016 Conference with Ken Abdo regarding entertainment deals. Conference call with Heirs' Counsel regarding agreements. Redline comments – Bravado Merch. Deal. Email exchange between lawyers regarding deals. Long-form commentary for UMG deal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Review/analyze 10/12/2016 Preparation of comments to UMG deal and Bravado deals. Conference calls with Bob Labate and others for discussion Review and discussion of emails from other entertainment attorneys including Abdo, Giselson and Labate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.00	\$4,320.00
Appear for/attend 10/12/2016 Travel to MSP – Memorial Concert	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (in firm) 10/13/2016 Conference with Bruntjen for discussion of deals	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.00	\$2,160.00
Appear for/attend 10/14/2016 Travel to LAX	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.00	\$2,880.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Communicate (other external) 10/17/2016 Conference calls with advisors and SA regarding licensing deals for Prince; review of other comments and notes regarding larger deals; UMG and Bravado	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/18/2016 Conference call discussion regarding proposal from Adrian Huermann of PriceWaterhouseCoopers regarding a buyout of heirs or purchase of the catalogue. Wheaton initiated the call and purpose; introduced Mr. Heurmann to the group of heirs' counsel and led discussion of offer. Deal has been in the works for months. Included in discussion are unreleased masters ("Vault") and the UMG deal. Comparison discussion among all heirs' counsel.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.50	\$4,680.00
Communicate (other external) 10/19/2016 Participated in meeting (via telephone) of NYC meeting with Advisors McMillan and Koppelman to discuss all entertainment deals as part of Heirs' Counsel team of advisors with Ken Abdo and Bob Labate; follow-up discussion with other Heirs' Counsel members including Siltan, Bruntjen Abdo, Giselson, etc.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	7.00	\$5,040.00
Plan and prepare for 10/20/2016 Preparation for comments to other counsel regarding advisor's meeting regarding music deals.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/21/2016 Entertainment Committee meetings and discussions Conference calls amongst heirs' counsel regarding status and changes on the contracts; UMG, Bravado Full discussion with heirs' counsel regarding Roc-Nation	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/22/2016 Conversations with counsel regarding Bravado deal. Discussion with Atty. Committee partner, Ken Abdo, Adam Giselson on Advisor comments and strategy.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	6.50	\$4,680.00
Communicate (other external) 10/23/2016 [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00
Communicate (with client) 10/23/2016 Confer with most of heirs' counsel regarding the deals on the table. Talk to Abdo and Labate .	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/24/2016 Heirs' Counsel prep for meeting of Entertainment Advisors Review of Joel's notes for comments on Bravado agreement and other entertainment deals. Speak with Charles and Londell regarding meeting and discussion notes. More discussion with Stinson/Bremer wind down issues.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/24/2016 Continuous discussions with PwC regarding potential revenue for the estate.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Communicate (other external) 10/24/2016 Various calls with heirs' counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.70	\$3,384.00
Communicate (other external) 10/25/2016 Prepare for conference call with Stinson, Londell, Charles, Ken Abdo and others for Bravado Agreement and others. Post conference conversations with others including Silton, Bruntjen, etc. Summaries prepared for remainder of Heirs' Counsel.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/26/2016 Continuous negotiations of deals on the table; discussion of unresolved issues; preparation of various emails to entertainment counsel, heirs' counsel; further talks with Londell and Charles; Review of summaries prepared by Abdo/Lommen with participation of Holland & Knight and Wheaton. Bravado Agreement discussion. Review of all other transactions taking place including UMG, UMPG, Sirius, GMR and Pandora.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 10/27/2016 Continued discussions with entertainment council; Disbursement of emails and information to heirs' counsel of deal notes with discussion. Bravado Agreement discussions continue, section 2.03, Discussion with most of the attorneys.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Review/analyze 10/28/2016 Review, analyses and discussion of current deals coupled with strategy with several counsel colleagues; Overview with Firm and Justin Bruntjen of deals.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 10/31/2016 Conference calls with Heirs' counsel regarding complete discussion of strategy and details of all six (6) deals currently being negotiated. A number of issues still need to be resolved. Discussion with entertainment committee members Labate, Abdo and others. Email exchange to Heirs' counsel concerning masters. Continuous review of ongoing entertainment deals. Constant prep for Heirs' counsel and clients.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00
Communicate (in firm) 11/1/2016 Heirs' Counsel discussion of issues arising with Roc Nation Conversations with colleagues, individually and collectively, regarding entertainment deals; licensing, real estate, vault and advisors. Conversation with Bob, Traci, Ken and Laura. Additional conversations with colleagues.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.70	\$4,104.00
Communicate (other external) 11/2/2016 SA provides notice of impending execution of the UMPG Agreement. Entertainment Committee prepares with responses and feedback regarding final issues and changes. Major Heirs' Counsel discussions and explanations of the final agreement. Discussion of Press Release from SA. UMPG issues Press Release, Heirs' Counsel discussion required. Heirs also request further discussions on remainder deals in progress.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Communicate (other external) 11/3/2016 Entertainment Committee discussion of the myriad of issues concerning protocols and review of contracts. Conversations with Heirs' counsel, Labate, Bruntjen, Silton, Abdo and others. Continuous review of contracts, notes and discussion of counsel regarding remainder deals including Bravado.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 11/4/2016 Emails, Conference Calls between Stinson, HK and Ken regarding the protocol and motions to be submitted. Email exchanges and discussions with colleagues.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 11/6/2016 Summaries of motions and notes prepared by Entertainment committee with notes distributed to Heirs' Counsel. Protocols discussed and presented to all attorneys. Review of strategies for remaining deals.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.30	\$3,816.00
Communicate (in firm) 11/7/2016 Conference Call – Heirs' Counsel – all in to discuss Entertainment and Personal Representative Agreement. Also discussion of motion re: Protocols. Motion for Protocol and Entertainment deal discussions throughout the day. Conversation with Justin to discuss and explain complexities of the deal.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (in firm) 11/8/2016 Review and discuss draft to Protocol Order; all Heirs' Counsel will review and contribute; unified Position and presentation to Stinson. Full discussion of Protocol and position of deals at the moment.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00
Communicate (other external) 11/9/2016 Conference call with Special Advisors; Londell, Charles with Ken Abdo and Bob Labate, Jorge and Adam Giselson telephone call to various Heirs' Counsel; Full discussion of Global Music Rights Agreement – Continue discussion regarding Other deals as well. Conversations re: Abdo/Lommen Replacement.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.80	\$3,456.00
Communicate (other external) 11/10/2016 Official replacement to Ken Abdo as Attorney rep to Heirs' Counsel. Discussions with Charles Koppelman Re: Cirque de Soleil. Special attorneys discuss the Nature of closing the deal transactions. Discussion of UMPG loan and security documents. Continued review of GMR and other deals.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 11/14/2016 Discussion re: protocols and deals with Bob Labate and other counsel. Of particular note, extra conversations and discussions with Bob Labate and SA to determine continued protocol of deals with Advisors and SA. Also review of Roc Nation proposal.	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.90	\$3,528.00
Communicate (other external) 11/15/2016 Discussions with Bob Labate re: Protocol and other issues prior to the submission of Motion for Protocol. Discussions with Stinson and Silton regarding protocols; SA sends copy of infringement action against Roc Nation. Review. Further discussions with Bob Labate re: Protocols and other matters	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.70	\$3,384.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Communicate (other external) 11/15/2016 call with Lebate about call with Stinson, look into issues with Roc Nation, and go over GMR agreement and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.60	\$4,032.00
Review/analyze 11/16/2016 prepare for call with SA on protocols, Infringement action against ROC Nation, prepare for teleconference with heirs counsel regarding same	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.30	\$3,096.00
Review/analyze 11/20/2016 GMR agreement and follow up and ROC Nation copyright issues	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.00	\$3,600.00
Review/analyze 11/21/2016 proposed protocol order, look at GMR long form, and follow up with Lebate, fee application for real estate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.30	\$3,816.00
Draft/revise 11/21/2016 GMR comments and edits, follow up with Lebate,	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.30	\$3,096.00
Draft/revise 11/22/2016 additional GMR revisions, follow up with Lebate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.50	\$3,960.00
Communicate (other external) 11/28/2016 call with Jorge about GMR agreement and further comments on long form	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Communicate (other external) 11/29/2016 talk with Lebate about conference call review of commitment letter, prepare for call	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00
Plan and prepare for 11/30/2016 call about GMR agreement and follow up comments, call with Lebate regarding commitment letter, and discuss revisions	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 12/1/2016 ROC Nation issues and live performance proposal and dick clark proposal	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 12/8/2016 SAs status of entertainment deals, long form Sirius, and draft edits to agreement, ROC Nation documents, Tidal paperwork, other SA documents	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.30	\$3,096.00
Review/analyze 12/9/2016 Tidal and NPG records	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.20	\$3,744.00
Review/analyze 12/12/2016 comments to Sirius XM agreement, review and discuss Cirque du Soleil agreement, teleconference with Lebate about Sirius, GMR, and other deals	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 12/13/2016 call with Lebate about GMR comments and edits, go over edits with co-counsel and discuss Sirius agreement	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.30	\$3,816.00

Time Entry	Billed By	Rate	Hours	
Review/analyze 12/14/2016 Global agreement, call with Lebate about Sirius agreement, draft comments	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.00	\$2,160.00
Review/analyze 12/15/2016 call with co counsel and Lebate about entertainment issues, call with SA about Sirius XM agreement and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.00	\$3,600.00
Review/analyze 12/20/2016 UMG agreement with heirs counsel comments, review First Tennessee Docs, changes, and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 12/21/2016 call with Lebate regarding UMG call, finalize UMG agreement, review all related documents, and follow up with other heirs counsel	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.30	\$3,816.00
Review/analyze 1/3/2017 call with HK about postponement UMG and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.50	\$2,520.00
Review/analyze 1/4/2017 revised UMG agreement, call with Lebate, and prepare for call with SA	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.70	\$3,384.00
Review/analyze 1/5/2017 discuss UMG agreement and follow up with Lebate and other heirs counsel including co counsel, prep for call with SA and advisors, and discuss with heirs counsel changes to be made to UMG	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	4.50	\$3,240.00
Review/analyze 1/6/2017 revisions to UMG agreement and follow up with heirs counsel and other issues, and call with Lebate	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.50	\$2,520.00
Review/analyze 1/9/2017 review comments and changes to most recent UMG agreement, consultant agreement and other issues, call with Lebate regarding heirs	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.00	\$1,440.00
Review/analyze 1/10/2017 call with Lebate regarding changes to UMG agreement and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	2.30	\$1,656.00
Review/analyze 1/11/2017 review UMG agreement and possible changes that need to be made follow up with call with Lebate with comments for advisors, consultancy agreements	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	3.50	\$2,520.00
Review/analyze 1/13/2017 review UMG agreement and new changes or comments, prepare questions or concerns for SA or advisors and follow up	Frank Wheaton	\$720.00	5.00	\$3,600.00
		<b>Time Entries Total:</b>	<b>344.20</b>	<b>\$247,824.00</b>

Subtotal	\$247,824.00
Total (USD)	\$247,824.00
Paid:	\$0.00
Balance	\$247,824.00