10-PR-16-46 Filed in District Court

State of Minnesota
1/21/2020 10:53 AM

From: Shirk, Yvonne

To: "Tyka Nelson"

Cc: Justice James Gilbert; Kemoshaw

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] From Tyka Nelson -

Date: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 10:25:27 AM

That's perfect — thanks! I'll let you know if for some reason they won’t allow me to file this as

correspondence into the file, otherwise you won’t have to do anything more. Have a good day.

Yvonne Shirk
Law Clerk to the Honorable Kevin W. Eide

604 E. 4 Street
Chaska, MN 55318
(952) 361-1438

From: Tyka Nelson [mailto:nelphiproductionsgospelmusic@yahoo.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 9:48 AM

To: Shirk, Yvonne <Yvonne.Shirk@courts.state.mn.us>

Cc: Justice James Gilbert <jhgilbert@lawgilbert.com>; Kemoshaw <kemoshaw@yahoo.com>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] From Tyka Nelson -

Hi again Yvonne,

If the judge orders that the payments go for the liens that’s just fine...Holland & Knight is first
| believe

Otherwise if the judge orders that they go to the heirs then they can come to me directly
I hope this is answers your question, but if not I’m available anytime
Thank you

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Tuesday, January 21, 2020, 9:42 AM, Shirk, Yvonne <Yvonne.Shirk@courts.state.mn.us>
wrote:

Ms. Nelson,

Can you please clarify direct payment to whom? Once we have that clarified, I’ll see if
I can file this email chain as correspondence, and save you having to do anything
further.

Yvonne Shirk
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Law Clerk to the Honorable Kevin W. Eide

604 E. 4 Street
Chaska, MN 55318

(952) 361-1438

From: Tyka Nelson [mailto:nelphiproductionsgospelmusic@yahoo.com]
Sent: Sunday, January 19, 2020 5:17 PM

To: Shirk, Yvonne <Yvonne.Shirk@-courts.state.mn.us>
Cc: Justice James Gilbert <jhgilbert@lawgilbert.com>; Kemoshaw

<kemoshaw@yahoo.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] From Tyka Nelson -

Hi Yvonne,

I have no objection to direct payment regarding fees of my consulting agreement

Is it possible for you to inform Judge Eide?

And please let me know what | would need to do on my end

Thank you so much
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Tyka Nelson

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the Minnesota Judicial
Branch. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the

sender and know the content is safe. If this email appears suspicious, or is
asking you to provide sensitive information, contact the ITD Service Desk for

further guidance.
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